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1/20/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Again, I come tonight to ask you to take an account of where you 
have stored your treasure. Have you stored your treasure in your material 
wealth? Your possessions? Have you stored your treasure in vanity? Have you 
stored your treasure in successes? What you hold closest to your heart is where 
you have allowed your treasure to be. And where are your brothers and sisters? 
Where am I? How often do you see the graces I have placed in your life. How 
many gifts have gone unrecognized by you? And your brothers and sisters? The 
very ones I have placed on your path. The ones I have given to you to tend to. 
Have you treasured them? Are they closest to your heart? Change from within. 
You must look within yourself first. See where your treasure lies. Then you will 
discover where you have placed your heart. Before you can give me your yes 
you must first give me your heart. Undefiled. Ready to let go of those things that 
are keeping you from me. The chasm you have allowed. I am the bridge. My love 
is the threshold you must cross. To accept my gift of salvation you must first free 
yourself from the chains you have allowed to be placed on you. I love you. You 
only need to ask, and I will help free you. Remember you belong to me because 
you belong to my Father. For this I have been sent. Come to me and do not 
delay. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

1/21/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Begin anew. This is the words I am giving each of you tonight. Do 
not harbor past hurts. Do not allow judgements of your brothers and sisters to 
pervade your thoughts. Do not allow anger to become your precipice with each 
other. Charity and forgiveness comes from the heart. Mercy is a choice to forgive 
someone their debts without the benefit of repayment. Have you shown mercy to 
those who are in need? Have you been willing to accept their efforts for 
reconciliation even if their efforts appear weak? How many times have you asked 
for the grace to overcome some large obstacle and offer only a small feeble 
sacrifice in return? Yet you were given this grace. How can you then say to your 
brother your efforts are not sincere enough for me to forgive you your debts? 
Begin anew. Look beyond the indifferences. Put aside anger and sow love. Begin 
by first coming to my heart as a source of refuge. I am the bread of life. Ask for 



my graces to bring about change within your own heart first. When you have 
forgiven then go to those who have hurt or offended you and offer them your gift 
of mercy. Bring them kindness and charity. It is only through love that one can 
win over their brother and sister. That is why love begets love. Tonight I desire for 
each of you to come to the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
Seek shelter within me. Pour out your libations and I will cleanse you. Lay your 
troubles at my feet and I will take them to my Heart. I am the great consoler. Give 
to me everything and I will bless your efforts. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
1/22/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to set a fire within each of 
you. Come tonight and enter the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Peer into your own hearts and see what you have sown. What you sow 
you will reap. When I come in all of my glory will you have a harvest that is 
bountiful to place before me? Will your fruits speak of your mercy towards those 
whom I have given to you? This will be the account that I will beckon from each 
of my Father's children. Those who have listened with their hearts will produce 
much fruits and will inherit the kingdom. Those who have heard my words but 
turned away only to bring forth a wasteland will also be turned away. My desire is 
for each of you to remain in me as I remain in you. Do not turn from me and forgo 
what I have come to offer you. Do not forgo this gift. Those who remain in me will 
taste the fruits of my suffering. They will receive the gift of salvation because they 
have remained with me until the end. Those who keep my commandments love 
me and I will lift them up on the last day. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
1/23/2013 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Let 
my Heart be a place of refuge for you. Those who enter into the chambers of my 
Heart reside in me and I in them. If you have become indifferent in your hearts, 
then you must listen to my words. Indifference does not come from hearts that 
are pure. Indifference comes from a heart that is defiled. A heart that has 
indifference no longer has a true conviction. Go out and seek what has inflicted 
your soul. Have you lost your convictions because you have allowed yourselves 
to become chained with the shackles of sin? Do you wear a crown of pride 
thereby not allowing your eyes to see the truth of your brothers and sisters? 
Pride will deafen your souls to my words. It is a darkness that consumes the soul 



and causes death. Return to me. Place your indifference at the foot of my cross 
for I am not indifferent. Place your crown of pride at my feet and I will clothe you 
in humility. I tell you this because I have worn a crown of love. Woven with the 
thorns of humility. Each thorn was a suffering I bore patiently for your salvation. 
Come to me and place yourself in my first chamber. Here you will find a fire of 
love that will burn with a charity for souls. I love you. Place everything at my feet. 
No longer do I wish for you to carry around your shackles. Place your shackles at 
my door. I will place you in my second chamber. I will cleanse you of your pride 
and wash away your indifference. I am the lamb who came down from Heaven to 
take away the sins of mankind. Trust in me. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
1/24/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. Witness your faith by serving them 
with charity. By searching out their needs and assisting them in their struggles 
you are becoming instruments of my love. Begin by seeking out your brothers 
and sisters within your family. Then to those I have given you. Finally move 
throughout the community. Every child you serve will bring many graces. Your 
efforts will become a blessing to those who are traveling with hardened hearts. I 
will look upon what you have done and place you in my fourth chamber. Here is 
where your treasure lies. Go out and recall my words. Whatsoever you do for the 
least of these, you do unto me, and I will remember your acts of charity. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
1/25/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come to me and do not delay. The hour is near, and I will come 
knocking at your door. Those who answer and invite me in, I will enter. I will dine 
with them and they shall be at my feast because they were prepared for my hour. 
If you knew when I was coming how would you greet me? Would you come with 
arms full of fruits? Would you have gifts of charity that you would place before me 
or would you come empty handed? Those who are not ready are like the guests 
who come underdressed for a big feast. They donned on attire that is unkempt 
and dirty. They remain in the distance, so the guest of honor doesn't recognize 
that they have dishonored him. Go and wash your faces with humility. Clean your 
clothes in the pool of faith. Place yourself at my feet and offer me your 
recompense. Then when I call out to those whom I have given to you they will 
give an account on your behalf. I shall say to you come and take a seat. You 



have prepared your heart and are ready to receive me. Go and take what I have 
told you. Prepare for my coming. Then you will not be caught off guard. I love you 
and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
 
1/26/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Give to me all of your doubts 
and place them at the foot of my cross. Leave behind your fears and insecurities. 
I have come to bring peace within you. To set your soul on fire. Give me 
everything and I will bless your efforts. Leave behind all of your weaknesses and 
struggles. Adversities and indifferences are no longer with you. All of this I shall 
remove from your heart through my love. Come to me and enter into the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart is truly a place of 
refuge. Within my chambers sinners are freed from the bondage of sin. Any child 
who enters my Heart will find solace and mercy. Their own hearts will become 
enflamed with a love of neighbor. Charity will become their fruits. How happy you 
will be when you enter into the New Jerusalem where every tear is wiped dry and 
only love abounds. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know 
this. 
 
1/27/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. My Heart is a refuge for sinners. Do not fear coming to me tonight. I see 
your struggles. I know that your hearts have become burdened once again. Do 
you not understand that my love is unconditional? That is why I am the great 
consoler. My Heart is a vessel of mercy for all souls. It is only by your lack of trust 
that you remain far from my Heart. You continue to choose pride over humility. 
You hold onto anger and forgo forgiveness. If only you could see how mercy 
brings about true change from within. When you show mercy, you have said to 
your brother, you have value. You are worthy to me and I love you. You give 
without receiving. That is a true gift. When I laid down my life for each of you, I 
was giving you a gift. Mercy. I gave without the benefit of repayment. That is why 
the gift of mercy has such value. Open your hearts to your brothers and sisters. 
By giving the gift of mercy to one another your own burdens will be lifted. I love 
you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 



1/28/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Tonight I desire for each of you to enter the chambers of my most 
Sacred and Merciful Heart. Those who abide in me and listen to my words 
belong to my Heart. Listen carefully to my words. They are truth. Those who go 
out among my lost sheep and care for their needs are my disciples. I say this 
because you have heard my words and followed them. They have taken root in 
your soul. Those who have listened to my words and have remained distant 
despite my continued pleas will remain lost because they live only for their own 
gratification and not for the Glory of the Father. Everyone who comes to me 
belongs to me. Just as everyone who walks away from me belongs to the world. 
Remain in me as I remain in each of you. Do not give me vain glory with your 
words. Give me the glory of your whole heart. When you pray do not pray with 
doubt or uncertainty. Pray with confidence that I will hear you and answer your 
prayers according to my will. Those who trust in me are happy because they 
know that my words are truth. I have opened my Heart to them, and they have 
entered freely with the trust of a child. Return to my Heart and do not delay. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
1/29/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children prepare your 
hearts for my Son. Renew your baptismal promises. Live according to his 
teachings. His words are truth. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. 
Know this. 
 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. Bring with you a trusting love of my 
words. They are truth. Give to those in need. Speak from a heart that is convicted 
in truth. Those who go out and assault others will reap upon themselves many 
burdens. Sow fruits of forgiveness. Give from a heart that remains unchided by 
worldly pleasures. Those who remain in me have already won. Let the enemy 
flee and my justice prevail, for I am the just judge ready to come before the world 
setting man against his brother and women against her children. Every soul will 
make an account before me. Those who have prevailed in this world and have 
not defiled themselves will join me in my Kingdom. Those who have refused to 
repent and accept my gift of salvation will be cast away into the fiery Gehenna 
where there will be wailing and grinding of teeth. Come and enter into the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. I am the door that leads to 



paradise. No one can go to the Father except through me. I am the way. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
1/30/2014 
Children it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children keep my son's 
teachings close to your own hearts. Be steadfast neither wavering nor giving up. 
Remember my Son has come first as your merciful savior. I love you and I give 
you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your, Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Be prudent in your daily choices. When you go out do not become 
prideful as to put to shame your brothers and sisters. Do not become arrogant 
towards anyone. Remember those who are arrogant will only bring about 
condemnation upon themselves. It is the humble who will receive consolation 
from my merciful Heart. Look upon each other with kindness. Practice giving from 
your hearts. Give without the benefit of repayment. Then your Father who sees 
everything will reward your acts of kindness. I love you. Tonight I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
1/31/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children remain 
steadfast as you walk along your roads. Do not let this journey become 
surrounded in doubt or fear. Your guardian angels are always present and ready 
to help light your way. You must listen and move quickly so as not to get lost. The 
road you are traveling on has many obstacles that you must overcome. My little 
ones I am with you and praying for you before the throne of God. Remain faithful 
to my Son and he will lead you to his heart. I love you and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
2/1/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come to me and do not delay. The chambers of my Heart are a refuge for 
sinners. Those who come to me will never be turned away. It is by your choices 
that you stray from me. Your hardened hearts towards your brothers and sisters. 
Your lack of charity. These are the obstacles that you must overcome. Those who 
enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart will receive my 
grace to overcome hatred. Their hardened hearts will be made soft. No longer 



will you see your brothers and sisters as strangers. Envy will be replaced with 
compassion. You will receive the grace of charity. Your hearts will become 
enlivened with a zeal for the faith. You will go out and bear fruit for the kingdom 
and I will reward your efforts. Take notice of what you have surrounded 
yourselves with. How have you distracted yourselves from me? Do you still 
receive my words with great anticipation? Or have you grown weary already? Do 
not become faint hearted. I love you. Tonight I have come to once again set a fire 
within you. Turn to me in this time of trial. I am here to comfort you and 
strengthen you. Those who believe in me will not fear I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
 
2/2/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Today I desire for each of you to go out and seek those who you 
have not reconciled with. Offer them forgiveness. How can you prepare your 
heart for me if you are still harboring anger towards your brothers and sisters? If 
you are unwilling to reconcile with them, how can you ask me to forgive 
you? What you sow you shall reap upon yourself. Sow seeds of reconciliation. 
Then when you stand before me, I shall find no fault within you. To each child you 
love I shall give an account of to my Father on your behalf. Charity begets 
compassion. Compassion brings about change from within. This is how I desire 
for you to ready yourselves. Change from within. Then you will go out and build 
my kingdom given to me by my Father. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
2/3/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Chosen and cherished are you by my Father in Heaven. How often I 
desire for you to truly understand this. You have been chosen and you are 
cherished by your Heavenly Father. He alone has given you life because he has 
loved you from the beginning. If you understood what I am telling you then surely 
you would keep my commandments. You would love your Heavenly Father 
above everything and because of this you would know that he sent me into this 
world to redeem you. You would truly see each other as the Father sees each of 
you. You would understand the value of your brother’s and sister’s souls. 
Therefore, you would love each other as I have loved you. Readily would you 
forgive. With mercy and compassion you would treat each other. Contemplate 
the words chosen and cherished. Then come to me once again. It is your hearts 



that I wish to change. Not from your own desire to appease me but true change 
from within. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
 
2/4/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Chosen and cherished are you by my Father. Tonight, I again wish 
to place these words on your hearts. Contemplate their meaning. What is it to be 
chosen and cherished? Do you recognize this within yourself? What about your 
brothers and sisters? Do you recognize that they are also chosen and cherished? 
Tonight, I wish for each of you to pray with an ardent desire to change your 
hearts from within. To understand the importance of why you are here. Each child 
holds great value in the Kingdom. That is why I laid down my life for you. My 
Heart is a vessel of mercy for every child. No one has been excluded. It is only 
by one's choice that they are removed from my Heart. Their choice. Not mine. I 
did not choose to only die for a select few. I offered my life as a ransom for all. 
Love each other as I have loved each of you. To do this you must first see why 
you are chosen. This answer is simple. Because you are loved. (Jesus pauses) I 
love you and I give you my priestly blessing. Know this. 
 
2/5/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your heart unto 
myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Open your hearts to receive the 
many graces I have poured out upon each of you. Every soul is important 
because every soul lives within a child of my Father. He alone is the creator, and 
he has brought each child into existence with his love. Each of you are cherished 
in Heaven. Every child is valued. That is why you each have an angel to watch 
over you. To help you on your journey. Every struggle that you happen upon, your 
angel is beside you to illuminate the truth. To help you see even in darkness. 
How often you close your eyes to truth and become deaf to the prompting of your 
angel. Open your hearts and your eyes will be opened too. Remove your pride so 
you can listen with humility. I love you. To bring about change you must first 
see. Ask for the grace to first recognize those items that are causing you to 
remain in darkness. What is hindering you in your efforts? I will place in your path 
opportunities to help you see with a greater awareness. This will be the graces 
that I will place in your soul. Discernment. You must accept this grace and use it 
wisely so you can learn. To truly see you must first have the desire to see. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 



2/6/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare for my coming. Let your faith in me be renewed. To bring 
about change you must first trust in me. I am mercy. Those who come to me shall 
not mourn. I am the great consoler. You only need to trust that I will console your 
heart. To trust in me is to accept everything from my heart. Even the struggles 
you are enduring. How many times have you encountered a trial and turned your 
heart away from me? You become indifferent to me because you are suffering. 
My child I too have suffered. I understand what it is to endure a trial. That is why I 
tell you come to me and do not be afraid. Even when you are suffering, I am 
there. Believe in what I am saying. Do not mourn when you are afflicted. Those 
who believe in me will not taste death. I will take you unto myself. Those who 
believe in me and trust in my mercy will belong to my Heart. They will reside in 
me and I in them. Seek shelter in me. I love you. Tonight I give you my priestly 
blessing. Know this. 
 
2/7/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Be faithful to the 
messages you are receiving. Open your hearts to my Son's words. They are 
truth. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. My Heart is a refuge for those who seek my shelter. I love you. Begin 
anew. Do not fear your past mistakes. Simply place them at my feet. Pick up your 
crosses and come follow me for I am meek and humble of heart. Return your 
hearts to my mercy. Those who have sought to do their own will instead of 
accepting mine will become lost. They will carry a heavy burden upon their souls. 
I have come to lift this weight. Did I not say to the paralytic pick up your mat and 
go?  Did he not have a heavy burden? Yet, I simply told him his sins were 
forgiven. Your burden has been lifted. Here I am telling you tonight do not fear 
your past transgressions. Simply lay them at my feet. Trust in my mercy. Then 
pick up your mats and walk freely knowing that your burden has been lifted. I 
have placed you in the chambers of my Heart. You have been made clean 
through my blood. A covenant poured out for the salvation of mankind. Trust. 
That is what I wish to leave with you tonight. Trust. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 



2/8/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Go out among my lost sheep. Love them as you would a friend. Truly I say 
to you no one should be lost to my Heart. To bring forth fruits you must first sow 
seeds. Your seeds must be strong and planted in soil that has been prepared. 
Then your harvest will grow and produce much fruit. To prepare your soil, you 
must go out among my sheep and listen to their souls. Beneath anger is fear. 
Beneath fear is a lack of trust. Talk about the chambers of my Heart. Let your 
own faith be a beacon of hope for those who have fallen away from me. Go to 
them and help minister to their needs. Some will need comfort. Others consul. 
Some will be weary and need a place to rest. Some will be hungry for truth. Feed 
them. Go out among my sheep and love them. They are your brothers and 
sisters whom I love. Place them in your own hearts. Show kindness and mercy. 
Then you will have won over your sibling. Prepare the soil around you so that 
when you sow seeds of faith they may grow and yield a bounty for the kingdom. I 
love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
 
2/9/2011 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Be prepared as you walk among my sheep. Bring with you hearts 
that are open towards other’s afflictions. Do not become discouraged when 
helping those who lack the ability to show kindness in return. Not everyone you 
meet will be welcoming. Some may spit upon you and send you to prison. Love 
them anyways. These are the sheep which I am talking about. Those who can do 
this and accept them into their heart will gain much. This is the mercy for which 
no payment will be received. Truly you will have laid down your own desires for 
your neighbor and accepted their indifference upon your flesh. You have 
resembled me in my sufferings. You will also resemble me in my glory. I love you. 
Enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. A refuge for 
those who are least in the eyes of the world but who are great in chambers of my 
Heart. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
2/10/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and prepare your hearts for my coming. Enter into the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Those who have prepared their 
hearts ahead of time is like a chef who prepares for a great feast. When the 



guests arrive there is only joyful anticipation because the hard work is complete. 
Everything is as it should be and ready to serve those awaiting. Prepare your 
hearts by emptying everything that causes you to remove yourselves from me. 
Choose only what will lead you to my Heart. My Heart is a place of refuge for 
sinners. It is a vessel for those who seek shelter within me. When you remove 
yourself from my Heart by your choices do not despair or become despondent. 
Simply return by way of repentance. Ask and you shall receive. No soul will be 
turned away from my mercy. That is why I have come. To set a fire within you. 
Come and enter. Prepare now for me. I will come and take you unto myself and 
claim you as my own. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
2/11/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Be steadfast especially when 
enduring trials. Remember that you are loved. Unite yourself to my most Sacred 
and Merciful Heart. Live in me as I live within you. Those who remain in me will 
not see death. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Be faithful to my Son in 
all things. Bear each trial with patience. Know that through your trust, my Son will 
lead you home. May my immaculate heart bring peace to each of you. My heart 
is a source of motherly love and protection for my children. You are loved. 
Tonight, I place each of you under my mantle of motherly love. Bear fruit my little 
ones by being good stewards with the many gifts you are receiving. I love you 
and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 
2/12/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Peer within your own hearts. Do you recognize when you are indifferent to 
me and to those I have placed on your road. Are you negligent because of your 
indifference. Apathy is a great afflicter of souls. One can harbor much hatred 
because of apathy. Remove this by taking a greater opportunity to serve them 
(our brothers and sisters). Indifference is caused from negligence. When you 
serve each other you learn. Your love becomes selfless and soon your hearts are 
softened. Many obstacles are overcome when hearts are changed. Change your 
heart tonight. Do not allow another night to come without changing your heart. 
Return to me and I will give you a zeal for the faith. Faith that you can return 
kindness and love towards afflictions. That your own heart will become like mine. 



A generous heart that is merciful to all. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
2/13/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Bring about change from within. To do this you must first desire to 
have change happen. Growth begins with change. The butterfly becomes a 
butterfly when the pupae changes from one stage into the next. Why do I talk 
about change tonight? Again, I ask you to peer into your own heart. How have 
you drawn closer to my Heart? I desire for each of you to change whatever is 
causing you to sin. Change whatever is causing you to tempt each other. I love 
you. I desire that each child grow in closer union with me. To bring about change 
you must first accept with great humility your imperfections. Then strive to grow. 
Remain steadfast and trust that I am with you. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
2/14/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Pick up your crosses and come follow me. I am the way, the truth, 
and the life. Anyone who comes to me will not be turned away. I will place you in 
the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Do not worry about 
condemnation. Do not fear coming to me. I am gentle of Heart. I have told you 
that I have not come to condemn this generation. No, I have come to save it. 
That is why I am telling you tonight, do not be afraid of condemnation. Rather 
seek counsel with me. Remain united to my Heart. If you become weakened, 
then strengthen yourself through my grace. If you fall do not be beleaguered. 
Instead pick up yourself and return to me, for I am mercy. If you struggle to get 
back up, then call my name. I will bring you out of the depths of sin and return 
you to my Heart. I am salvation. Anyone who comes to me will not be left outside. 
I will invite them in to dine with me. We will break bread and I will be the true food 
that your soul seeks. I am the bread of life. Those who eat of me and drink my 
blood will have life within them. I will raise them up on the last day. Those who 
belong to my Heart will not fear because they are mine. I will testify on their 
behalf before my Father. He will love them because I have loved them. This I tell 
you because my words are true. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
 
2/15/2014 



Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Remove all of the distractions 
that are causing you to sin. What are you allowing to pervade your soul? Is it 
envy? Pride? Gluttony? Have you become lukewarm already? Each moment I 
have given you. Each moment is a new opportunity to change. Each moment you 
can begin anew. Simply return to my Heart. Give me your yes. Come before me 
with hearts that are contrite. I will place you in my second chamber. I will heal you 
from your afflictions and cleanse you of your sins. My mercy I shall place in your 
soul. My graces will become your armor against temptation. But you must use my 
graces. If you take this armor and simply lay it on the ground, how can it defend 
you? How are you protected? No. You must pick up the armor and clothe yourself 
with it. Then when you go out you are prepared. Your Heart is ready for battle. It 
is my grace that will protect you. I will defend you as my own. I love you. Know 
this. Tonight I give you my priestly blessings. 
 
2/16/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Tonight, I desire for you to go out and 
offer comfort to the afflicted. Shower them with kindness. They belong to my 
Heart. The more you offer yourselves the sooner you begin to grow. Your hearts 
change and become like beacons of light shining forth in darkness. This light will 
guide others to see me even in the most darkest of places. A person's 
woundedness. Go out and love. Do not just love those who shower you with 
affection in return. Love my sheep who can offer you nothing. They are the least 
of whom I have spoken about. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
 
2/17/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. My Heart is a refuge for sinners. To turn away from sin is to trust in my 
mercy. You must look past everything that is causing you temptations. Seek me 
out. My mercy is as endless as the oceans. Come to me and do not delay. No 
longer do I desire for you to separate yourself from me. Seek shelter in my Heart. 
Let my graces become a stronghold for you to place at your side. Ready to draw 
from during times of hardship and trials. Ready yourselves for battle by preparing 
your hearts for my coming. Those who prepare ahead of time will not become 
displaced. They will have remained steadfast as they continue on awaiting for my 
coming. I love you. Tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 



 
2/18/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Bring souls to the foot of my cross. Here I will cleanse them and 
make them new again. Whoever seeks my will, will find it. My will is this. That you 
believe in me. Listen to my words. They are truth. Do not forgo what I have given 
to you. Do not allow yourselves to become slaves to this world. Everything I have 
given to you. Out of my love for each child my mercy pours forth. I do not say my 
mercy is for those who deserve it. No. My mercy is for all. Yes, even those 
children whom this world has declared unlovable. Undesirable. Unfit for human 
compassion. Not worthy of redemption. These are the children whom my Father 
loves. For this I have been sent. To save the lost sheep. Bring everyone to the 
foot of my cross. Salvation is for any child who believes in me and gives me their 
yes. They belong to my Heart and my mercy shall rest on them. I love you and I 
give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
2/19/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and do not delay. My Heart is open for every child who comes 
to me. Do not fear coming to me tonight. I tell you the truth, even if your sins are 
many, my mercy is still greater than your many sins. I have come to set a fire in 
your own hearts tonight. To prepare you for my coming. Seek out my lost sheep. 
Go to them and talk about my mercy. Teach them about the Chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. It is by way of this devotion that many souls will 
be saved. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
2/20/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. Bring them gifts of the spirit. Offer 
them compassion and kindness. Show them the importance of servitude towards 
each other. Those who have become great should bear much for those who have 
less. Each should help the other. When dividing up the fruits each child should be 
given fair wages. According to each person’s needs. If a child is struggling take 
time to bring them comfort. A soothing word, a compassionate heart. Those who 
are struggling with difficulties of forgiveness. Offer counsel. Let your words bring 
about understanding. Forgiveness restores unity among my sheep. Every child is 
important. That is why one must forgive. Remember that forgiveness comes from 
a heart that is selfless. The more you forgive the more you will grow. I love you. 
Go out among my lost sheep and bring them to the chambers of my most Sacred 
and Merciful Heart. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 



 
2/21/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. Return (them) to my Heart. Do not 
bring with you gold or silver. You cannot buy what I am offering you. Bring with 
you truth. Be convicted in what you are saying. When you talk about the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart know that I am with you. My 
chambers are open and ready to receive every child who desires to enter. One 
does not need to be perfect. Nor do they have to be free of sin. They only need 
to be ready to give me their yes. To have contrition for their past mistakes and 
trust in my mercy. Then they shall enter into the abode of my Heart. A vessel of 
mercy where sinners can find refuge. Those who enter my Heart will find peace. I 
shall comfort them during times of distress. In their woundedness I shall heal 
them. That is why I tell you to go out. Be convicted in what you say. Speak the 
truth. Then no one will find fault with you. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
2/22/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Begin anew tonight. Do not harbor past hurts. Put away all 
disparaging insults. Now is the hour that every child returns to me. Enter into the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Abide in me as I abide in you. 
So many graces have been received. So many gifts have still gone without true 
appreciation. How you utilize your gifts show how much you have understood 
their value. Forgiveness is a grace to not only accept your brothers’ faults, but it 
is to also remember their sins no more. When you can love your brother or sister 
without regarding what they have done or the difficulty that they have sown 
through their poor choices, then you have begun to truly forgive. Mercy is just 
that. Forgiving your brother or sister without the need for them to repair or repay 
for damages. When you show mercy you have entered into the deepest level of 
my fourth chamber. Here is where your treasure lies because you have loved as I 
have loved. When you forgive from your heart you resemble me, since I have 
forgiven freely and without payment. I have forgiven mankind his debts because 
of my love and fidelity. Those who wish to follow me must learn to forgive as I 
have forgiven. To love as I love. To carry their cross and follow me. I am the way. 
Those who follow me will have true happiness. Their hearts will be a dwelling 
place for me and I will claim them as my own. I love you. Tonight I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 



2/23/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Begin anew. Tonight, I ask each 
of you to remove those obstacles that are causing you to sin. If anger has 
become your obstacle, then remove it by showing acts of kindness towards those 
who frustrate you. Be patient with the elderly. Be generous with your time. If 
gluttony has become your obstacle remove it. Fast from your selfish desires by 
offering what you have to those who are less fortunate. Do not fill yourselves with 
only things that gratify you. Fill your hearts with selfless care towards your 
brothers and sisters. If pride has become your stumbling block. Remove it. Learn 
from the less fortunate. They do not go about bragging for their material 
possessions. They do not build monuments to themselves. They live simply. 
Become humble then when you have received accolades for your efforts 
remember everyone who made your road less daunting. Each success comes 
with many people’s efforts yet only a few will be seen. Know this. My Father sees 
each child's efforts and he rewards them accordingly. Tonight, I desire for each of 
you to remove the obstacles from your hearts that are causing you to sin. Do not 
be afraid if you find that you have many obstacles. I love you. My Heart is your 
refuge. It is by way of my chambers that souls are saved. Each chamber is a 
doorway to a further understanding of my great love for you. Each chamber 
teaches you how to become selfless. Those who reside in my chambers will 
never be afraid. They know that they are mine and they belong to me. I love you 
and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this.  
 

2/24/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Within each chamber a soul will learn love. A soul will begin to see through 
the eyes of faith the many graces that have been poured forth for mankind. Do 
not be afraid of approaching me. My Heart is a refuge for all who seek my 
shelter. When you come and enter into the chambers of my Heart do not fear 
what you may see within your own heart. Many will see their own failings. That is 
why I have come. To remind you that I am mercy. Those who seek my 
forgiveness will never be turned away. My second chamber is where a sinner can 
go and find comfort. They will understand at what price their sins have been 
remediated. They will also see the value of a soul. I love you. For this reason, I 
have come and poured out my mercy upon the whole world. Not by my own 
authority but by the one who sent me. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 



   
2/25/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Return your hearts to me. Do not abandon what I have offered you. 
Taking instead temporal pleasures that will only give you momentary happiness. 
Return to my Heart. Within the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart 
true happiness exists. True happiness exists because my Heart is a refuge. It is a 
dwelling place for any child who wishes to enter. My Heart is a source of life for 
those who have become lost. My Heart is food for those who hunger and thirst 
for righteousness. Come to me and do not delay. My Heart belongs to any child 
who calls out to me. From the deepest reaches of your heart, I hear you. You do 
not belong to this world. You belong to me. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
  
2/26/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Go out among my lost sheep and offer them what you have been told. 
Teach them about the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. If you 
receive a grateful welcome, then continue to teach. Sow seeds of faith among 
them. If you receive a welcome that is full of disdain. Do not become troubled by 
this. Pray ardently for their salvation. Many souls will be saved by way of the 
chambers of my Heart. Be patient even if you are ridiculed. Offer love even if you 
receive hatred. Be humble in the sight of arrogance. Take pity on those who have 
come to cause harm. They are frightened and confused. They have been led 
astray. They are my lost sheep. Do you not recall what I have told you. The 
importance of even one soul. My Heart aches for souls that remain far from me. 
They have become indifferent to my teachings. Love them anyway. Seek nothing 
for yourselves. Neither praises nor compensation. What you have freely been 
given you must freely give. I will see your heart as you go about doing what I 
have instructed you to do. Love. Then you will not be led astray. I love 
you. Tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this.  
2/27/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Have hope. Do not 
become beleaguered. I love you my little ones. Tonight, in particular I wish to 
place each of you under my mantel of motherly love. Do not forget that you are 
chosen and cherished by your Heavenly Father. He alone gives you life. My little 
ones if you knew how loved you truly are you would dance for joy. Listen to my 
Son. His words are truth. I love you my little ones and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this.  



 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly king, calling each of you unto my heart. 
Remove those obstacles that are causing you to sin. If avarice is your struggle, 
then come to me. Place this struggle at the foot of my cross. Then go out and 
take care of what you have. Love. My grace alone is sufficient for you. Do you 
not know that I will give you whatever you ask for. Providing, what you ask for is 
not in conflict with my plan for you. I love you. Do not go out and cause others to 
fall because of your weakness. Set an example for others. Your actions should 
not be in conflict with what you say. Be truthful. If gossip has become your 
downfall learn to speak plainly and without harm. Do not let your words wound 
another's soul. Keep watch over your words so that you will not have your words 
held against you at judgement. I love you. Remember this. Tonight I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
2/28/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. A Heart that has been pierced for you. My mercy is endless and so is my 
compassion for those who trust in me. Do not be afraid. I have loved you always. 
Reach out to me when you are troubled. Call to me when you are scared. Speak 
to me when you are lonesome. I am here. My Heart is open to each of you. No 
one is excluded from my mercy. It is only through your lack of trust and 
indifference that causes you to be divided from me. I tell you that I love you. My 
love is not based on your actions or inactions. My love for you comes from a 
Heart that took upon all of your sins. Your complacency, your indifference, your 
pride, your selfish desires. How many condemnations I received from those who I 
loved. How many children mocked me and spit at me. Yet only a few came to 
comfort me. Did I only love those few? Did I only offer my life for their salvation? 
No! I loved those who mocked me. I looked at those who spit at me and asked 
my Father to forgive them. My mercy was already present. When I was 
condemned my Heart was already being pierced with the sin of enmity. Every trial 
I was met with injustice. Each step was taken with hearts that stared at me coldly. 
My Heart was never cold. I did not reject even one of my accusers. Why then do 
you think that I would reject you now? I love you. My Heart is always ready to 
receive those who come to me. Do not fear me. I love you. Come to me and do 
not delay. My Heart is a refuge for all. You only need to trust. I love you and I give 
you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/1/2014 



Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. To understand salvation, you must first enter into the chambers of my most 
Sacred and Merciful Heart. This is where you will find salvation. My Heart is a 
vessel of mercy. It is a cistern where graces abound. Salvation is a gift. Just as 
mercy is a gift. To receive mercy, you only need to ask. To receive salvation, you 
only need to trust. Those who seek my mercy and trust in my gift of salvation 
know my Heart. This is because they have followed my teachings and accepted 
my words. They have chosen to live in me as I live in them. This is what I wish to 
impart on you tonight. You are loved. My mercy and my gift of salvation is for all 
of my Father's children. No one has been excluded. It is only by your choices and 
lack of wanting that keeps you from me. Just know that I am here. Ready to 
receive you in every chamber. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
  
3/2/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare your hearts for my coming. As you go out among my sheep bring 
with you a temperament of tolerance for other’s afflictions. The more you can 
show compassion and understanding, the more my mercy will abound. Give to 
others what you have received. Sow peace. Sow faith. Grow a garden so others 
may benefit from your yield. Then you will earn treasure in Heaven. Remember 
what you sow you will also reap. Become peacemakers among my sheep. Then 
you can become a light for those who are living in darkness. I am the light. Those 
who believe in me will remain in my light. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

3/3/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out and bring light to those who live in darkness. Become a 
joyful reminder of my mercy to those who have despair. Give from your hearts. 
Help those in need. Love one another. This I ask of you tonight. To go out and be 
a reminder to the world that you belong to me. What you sow, you will reap. So, 
sow peace. Then you will be great in the kingdom. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings.  
3/4/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Each chamber is an opportunity to grow in holiness. Each chamber brings 



a soul into closer union with me. Anyone who enters into the chambers of my 
Heart will never go hungry or thirsty again. My Heart is true food. My blood true 
drink. Whoever believes in me will have eternal life. For this is the reason that I 
came. To bring Souls back to my Father. That no one should perish but all should 
be saved through me. I love you. Give testimony to this. I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

3/5/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. My peace I give to you. Go out and be a sign to others. Bring with you my 
peace and offer it to everyone you greet. What you have freely received you 
must also freely give. This is how you are to go out among my sheep. Be a 
servant. Give without expecting repayment. Sow kindness and charity. Be 
peacemakers. When given an opportunity to teach do so with compassion. 
Always remembering that every word carries with it consequences. Words can 
bear fruit, but they can also yield much despair. Choose your words wisely. I love 
you. Go out among my sheep and bear fruit. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
3/6/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming.  I tell you the truth, I will come 
like a thief in the night. How are you to prepare then. Remain firm.  Do not be 
swayed by things that are here today and gone tomorrow. Remain in me as I 
remain in you. Keeping what I gave taught you close to your heart. Then when I 
come in all of my glory you will be ready. I will ask of you an accounting of your 
deeds. How have you given of your talents. Did you live a life faithful to my 
words. I love you. Ponder what I am telling you. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/7/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Enter by way of your yes. When you give me your yes you are accepting 
my will. You are stating that you belong to my Heart. No longer do you stand 
outside. You have knocked and the door was opened. I opened the door when 
my Heart was pierced with the lance. Everything was offered for you.  Now my 



Heart is a dwelling place. A refuge for the lost and broken. Do not remain far from 
me. Come and enter. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this.  
 

3/8/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My 
mercy is for every child who seeks it. Do not be afraid. Do not fear me. I am 
meek and gentle of heart. I have come tonight to ask each of you to place the 
needs of another ahead of yourself. Be merciful just as I have shown you mercy. 
Love is a sacrifice of self. Comforting a stranger. Inviting someone in. Breaking 
bread. Forgiving your enemy. Love is selfless. I ask each of you to love. Renew 
your baptismal promises and return to a life of holiness. Remembering the joys of 
giving and how important each of you are. You have been chosen and cherished 
by your Heavenly Father. Receive what I am telling you with hearts that are open 
and willing to change. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
3/9/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Recognize within your own hearts your failings. See what areas you are 
struggling with. Contemplate with much love how you can grow in grace. Only 
through my Heart will you be saved. Even if you struggle. You shall not fear. My 
Heart is your refuge. My blood is salve for your woundedness. It is by way of my 
cross that mankind was lifted up. My death freed you from the bonds of sin. 
Come to me and do not delay. I love you. Come and be healed. Come and once 
again be united to me. Do not allow your weaknesses to consume you. Do not 
become burdened with doubt. Trust in me. I am mercy. Those who come to me 
will not be turned away. I will welcome you and invite you in. Those who enter 
into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart reside in me and I in 
them. You who hear my words and live by them will have eternal life. For this 
purpose have I been sent. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know 
this. 
 
3/10/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Place your worries at my feet. Put everything in front of my cross. 
Trust. I hear you. I understand what you have been holding onto. Your hearts are 
not hidden from me. Just as I have not kept my Heart from you. My Heart is a 
dwelling place for all. You only need to give me your yes. To trust that I am here. 



That I love you. Trust that I have come to bring you hope. To unite you to the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. I love you my children. 
Take what my Son has told you and return to him. Leave behind your evil 
practices. Change the way you have been living. Take each moment and offer it 
to my Son. Ask for his help. Seek counsel and petition his Heart for mercy. He 
loves you my little ones. No child goes unnoticed. Each of you are chosen and 
cherished. See this in each other. I love you my little ones. Know this. Tonight I 
place each of you under my mantle of motherly love. 
  
3/11/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Bring about change within your own hearts. Then go out and serve 
each other. I tell you this because you have hearts that are hard. You still see 
each other with indifference. You judge and show no mercy. Look within your 
hearts and see where your hearts have become indifferent. How many times 
have I given you opportunities to serve and instead you complain? You mock 
those I have sent you. Why do you not see that they belong to me? If you have 
love for me then you must also love those I have given you, because they are 
also mine. Be merciful. Then when I give you my sheep to feed you will not only 
feed them but also care for them. You will serve them, not with contempt, but with 
mercy. Now your hearts that were once calloused will become soft with 
compassion. Those who love me will keep my commandments. This I command 
of you. Love one another as I have loved you. Then what your Father in Heaven 
sees will be rewarded. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/12/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out and learn from what you have received. Understand my 
words by living my teachings. As you search for the meaning search first for my 
Heart. Then you will find the truth. Serve one another. Then you will find love. 
Love is always found in giving. Just as seeds bear fruit. Selfless acts of charity 
bear love. If you want to grow in holiness, then believe in me. Learn from my 
example. Trust that I will provide for you. That is faith. To trust in me just as a 
child trusts in their father and mother. Trust in me and you will receive eternal life. 
I am the way, the truth, and the life. Those who believe in me will never die. They 



will live in me and I in them. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know 
this. 
 
3/13/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Bring with you hearts that are full of compassion when you go out 
among my sheep. Be joyful as you encounter your brothers and sisters. If they 
mock you, love them. If they cause you harm, forgive them. If they curse you, 
bring them to the foot of my cross. Truly I tell you that when you do this, you have 
gained my favor. Listen to my words. They are truth. You have been given this 
time as a gift. Use it wisely. Do not let nightfall come before you have forgiven 
those who I have given to you. Do not harbor anger. Do not focus on how you 
have been insulted. Look at me. How many times did I receive insults? How 
many injustices did I endure? Forgive your brothers and sisters just as I have 
forgiven you. Do not measure a man by worldly possessions. Measure a man by 
his heavenly treasure. Go and seek first the kingdom of God. Then surely your 
efforts will merit you treasure. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
  
3/14/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and renew your hearts to me. Prepare now for my coming. I tell 
you the truth I will come at an hour you do not know so remain awake. Do not 
allow night to come and catch you asleep before you have entered into the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Those who have entered my 
Heart will be saved. I tell you this because they have chosen to remain in me as I 
in them. They have believed in my teachings and followed closely. They have 
kept watch and awaited my return with open and joyful hearts. They are my 
sheep and I am their Shepard. They belong to me and I shall raise them up on 
the last day. Listen to what I am telling you. Soon I will come in all of my glory. I 
shall set before all men my seat of judgement. Each one shall come before me 
and I shall take an account of their deeds. Those who have kept my word and 
cared for those whom I have given, will take their seat at my banquet. Those who 
have failed to keep my commandments, who did not care for those whom I have 
given, who did not repent at the time of my coming shall be taken out just as the 
chaff is discarded from the wheat. They shall not dine with me or take a seat at 
the banquet. Do not fear what I have said. This is to remind you of my coming. 
Prepare your hearts   I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Those who 



believe in me and follow my teachings will have eternal life. Do not be afraid. I 
shall raise you up on the last day. Know this. 
  
3/15/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Go out among my sheep. Feed them. Comfort them. Bring them to the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Do this through a living 
testimony of your faith. What you sow you will reap. I ask you tonight to go out 
among my sheep and sow seeds of compassion through charity. Sow seeds of 
forgiveness through mercy. Sow seeds of faith through love. Be consistent. Be 
selfless. Remain in me by accepting my will. When you accept my will, you have 
given me your yes. If every child could understand how much I desire to give 
them my Heart. To unite myself to them by way of my chambers. That is why I am 
asking each of you to go out. I send you out like sheep among the wolves but do 
not be afraid. You are not orphans. You belong to me. You are mine. I send you 
out so that others may come to believe. They will know that I have sent you and 
that you belong to me. They will see that you have accepted my will and have 
given me your yes. Do not turn even a single one of my sheep away. Their souls 
are precious. Every child belongs to my Father in Heaven. No child should ever 
be lost. Trust that you are loved. Trust that you are wanted. You belong to me 
and thereby belong to my Father because he has willed it so. I love you and I 
give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/16/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children listen to the 
words of my Son. His words are truth. Live according to the teachings you have 
received. Show kindness. Obey the commandments. Be fruitful. Only when you 
return your hearts to God will you have true peace. My little ones you belong to 
God. That is why you become despondent when you remove yourselves from his 
Heart. Unity to God was restored through my Son. This gift has been given to 
each of you. Your lack of love and unwillingness to repent causes you to remain 
in darkness. Repent and return to God's Heart. My Son is the way. Accept his 
teachings and enter by way of the chambers of his Heart. I love you my little 
ones. I pray for your conversions. Know this. 
 

Brothers and Sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming. Return to my Heart. I love you. If you struggle to 
believe this know that I have offered everything for your salvation. Even my life 



was given as a sacrifice for you. I am the good Shepard who laid down my life for 
my sheep. Those who listen to my words and believe in me are my sheep. I call 
my sheep and they answer me. But you who have remained far from me. Where 
are you tonight? Do not hide in fear of my voice. My voice is not one of 
condemnation. My voice is one of salvation. Come to me and do not delay. I have 
not come for only those who are just. I have come to reclaim those who have 
become lost. Yes, you who have ignored me and remained far from me. I have 
not forgotten you. You are not far from my Heart. No, on the contrary, I love you. 
Yes you, who have offered me no comfort. I love you, who has returned my gift 
with impiety. No child is excluded from my mercy. You only need to seek shelter 
in my Heart. Rejoice and be glad. This day Heaven rejoices because a child who 
was once dead has returned to life. One who was lost has returned home to my 
Heart. Believe me when I tell you that you are that child. I have never given up on 
you. You belong to my Heart. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
  
3/17/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be brave 
during this time of trial. Place yourselves at the foot of my Son's cross. Here you 
will find shelter. The sooner you repent and return to his Heart the sooner you will 
become whole. You will not be divided. Give your heart to my Son who is truth. I 
love you my little ones. I am praying always for your hearts to become like that of 
my Son. Full of compassion and mercy. Slow to anger and quick to forgive. My 
little ones each day grows a little longer now. Soon you will see growth return to 
your fields. Now is the time to ask yourself what kind of seeds will you plant and 
what type of soil will your seeds be planted in. I love you my little ones. Know 
this. 
  
Tonight, I could see our Blessed Mother cradling the infant Jesus in her arms. 
  
3/18/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be careful 
with your choices. Be ardent in your prayers. Remember that this is a time of 
grace. A great trial will befall mankind. Much suffering will occur. Practice the 
many teachings you have received. Read scripture in your homes. Teach your 
children about God's great gift of mercy. Take care of the elderly. Be faithful to 
God. Do not let fear manifest itself in your hearts. You belong to God. Remain in 
his Heart and you will have joy even in the darkest of hours. Look to my Son for 



courage. My children he is salvation. Those who believe in him are already free. 
They will have eternal life. This my little ones is a precious gift. A gift that was 
given freely from the sacrifice of my only Son. Do not take this gift for granted. Do 
not offend my Son by your lack of gratitude. Indifference is what caused my Son 
to shed many tears. My own heart has been pierced. Children now is the time to 
return your hearts to God. Place yourselves at the foot of my Son's cross. Give 
him your yes and enter into the chambers of his most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
His Heart is a refuge. So go and seek shelter with him. I love you my little ones. 
Know that I am praying for each of you and place each of you under my mantle 
of motherly love. Tonight I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/19/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it's I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my sheep. Offer kindness and charity. Sow seeds of 
faith by your testimony of compassion. Each child can bring about comfort 
towards their brothers and sisters. Each child can offer forgiveness to their 
offender. Each of you can change your own hearts and repent of your wrong 
doings. Do you still not understand that all of this can come from you. Just trust in 
me and know that I will assist you by way of graces. You only need to ask. My 
mercy and compassion is for any child who asks. Seek out my Heart. Then you 
will truly find comfort. Come and dwell with me. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

3/20/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be faithful to 
the messages you are receiving. Bring about faith by witnessing in your 
compassion towards each other. Remember you are all called to be holy. Each of 
you are precious to God. When you struggle with compassion look to my Son, he 
is compassion. Remember how he carried himself. With a cross upon his back. 
Remembered how he walked. Falling among the rocks and thorns. What kind of 
a crown did he wear? One made of thorns. (Our Lady showed me the words 
bramble and thicket). Be brave my little ones. What my Son did, he did out of 
compassion for you. He bore your sins because he loved you. Compassion 
comes from love. This is what my Son has taught. To love each other. My little 
ones I desire that you start to sow seeds of compassion. Those seeds will grow 
into faith. Faith will become the fruits of love. Love will become mercy. Become 
children that bear the fruits of mercy. I love you my little ones. Tonight I give you 
my motherly blessings. Know this. 
  



3/21/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to bring you back to my 
Heart. Come to me and enter the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Tonight, I ask each of you in particular to return to me. Do not fear coming 
to me because you have found yourself unworthy. Do not fear coming to me 
because you have been hiding in darkness. I tell you the truth there is nothing 
that you can reveal that will separate us. I am mercy. Only your lack of trust 
separates us. If you have fallen, then come and I shall pick you up. If you have 
sinned against your neighbor. Come and I will give you the graces necessary to 
seek their forgiveness. Nothing is too great that I cannot forgive. My mercy is 
endless and so is my compassion. Come and enter into the chambers of my 
Heart. Here I will comfort you and bring you back to my Father in Heaven. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/22/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Keep moving forward bringing with you what you have learned. 
Bring with you joy, bring with you kindness and sincerity. As you walk along your 
road share with those you meet these beautiful gifts. Give joy. Give comfort. Be 
sincere. What you offer is love. Seeds of faith that will grow and prosper. I love 
you. Walk with an ardent desire to give. What you receive will be an opportunity 
to reach those who have become little and unimportant in the eyes of the world. 
But to me they are my sheep. Cherished and chosen by my Father in Heaven. 
Loved and redeemed by my precious blood. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
  
3/23/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep and teach them about my mercy. Ask if 
they are hungry. Then give them something to eat. If they accept your food, you 
have won over their hearts. Go out among my lost sheep and return them to my 
Heart. Ask if they are thirsty. If they answer yes, go and give them a drink. If they 
accept your drink, you have won them over. Go out and bring my lost sheep back 
to my Heart. Now when you have given them food and drink, ask if they need 
shelter from the cold. If they answer yes, bring them in and keep them warm. If 
they go with you, you have won over their hearts. I tell you the truth whenever 
you offer this in my name you have done it to me. I am the bread of life. My blood 
is true drink. My Heart is a true dwelling place. Go and win over my lost sheep 
through your acts of kindness. Then teach them about my mercy. Talk about the 



chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Because of your sincerity they 
will hearken unto you. Bring them to me. If they knock upon my door surely, I will 
answer and invite them in. They shall dine with me and I will make my dwelling 
with them. This is what I ask of you. Become true disciples of my Heart. By 
accepting this you have accepted my will. Those who hear me and answer me 
are my sheep. You who have heard me and accepted my teachings are already 
my sheep. I tell you this, you will not be left wanting for anything. I myself will 
raise you up on the last day. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
  
3/24/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Place yourselves at the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
Give me your yes and come and enter my Heart. Each chamber is ready to 
surround you with love and mercy. My Heart is a dwelling place for any child who 
believes in me. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/25/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Keep watch. The hour may come upon you. What will you do when this 
hour comes? Do not be caught off guard supposing that my arrival is late I can 
assure you I will come at an hour you do not know. Take heed and watch. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
Children it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. I come tonight bringing 
you much love. Children know that you are always in my prayers. Please I 
implore you to listen to my Son. His words are truth. Do not be eager to accept 
what is easy and forsake what is truly necessary for your spiritual growth. Many 
times you have been given some difficulty or cross to bear. This is a struggle but 
do not be eager to give up or worse abandon your cross all together. Look my 
little ones at how difficult my Son's cross was to bear. It was out of his love for 
you and his ardent desire to accept his Father's will that helped lead him to 
victory. You too can become victorious. Trust in my Son. Be patient and endure 
your trials with a willingness to sacrifice. Then when my Son comes he will find 
you working and keeping watch. I love you my little ones. Persevere and know 
that you are loved. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/26/2014 



Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Begin anew this day. For this day has been made for you.  Be at peace 
and know that I am with you until the end. Although you have difficulties ahead of 
you, I have not abandoned you. No, I wish to place you in the chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Come and enter. I will give you rest. My Heart is 
a place of refuge. I am the bread that has come down from Heaven. Whoever 
eats of my flesh and drinks my blood will have life within them. Do not become 
discouraged with your difficulties. Do not let the day burden your soul. Give to me 
all of your troubles and I will open the floodgates of my mercy to pour out upon 
you. Place all of your efforts at my feet and I will bless you. I love you and tonight 
I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

3/27/2014 
Children it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Be eager for truth. My 
Son is truth. Listen to his words and enter into the chambers of his Heart. He is 
Lord. Know this. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. 
  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come to me and do not delay. My Heart is open to every child who 
trust in my mercy. My Heart is a vessel of graces. Those who receive my words 
and teaches them to others will grow in wisdom. I tell you this because one 
learns as one teaches. How quickly you will learn when you take the time to 
teach. I love you. Give what you have received. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/28/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
Within each chamber you will find opportunity to grow. First by accepting my will, 
by giving me your yes. Repenting of your transgressions and trusting in my 
mercy and forgiveness. Praying for the redemption of your brothers and sisters 
and finally through acts of charity. Every chamber helps you to grow in holiness. 
The more you grow in holiness the more you are able to understand what love is. 
Understanding love will help you to see the value of every life. You are cherished 
because you are loved. When you love you will begin to also cherish your 
brothers and sisters. Then you will be ready for me when I come in all of my 
glory. You will stand before me and I will ask an accounting from you. How easy it 
will be for you because you have kept shelter within me. You lived within the 



chambers of my Heart. You learned love and how to love. You will have much to 
show me and I will in turn bless your efforts. You will be considered great in the 
kingdom because you have loved much. My mercy and blessings will be with 
you. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this.  (Jesus asks us to 
strive to live within his heart. To always unite ourselves to him. Especially in times 
of difficulty.) 
  
3/29/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Do not grow weary. Do not become complacent. You must go and walk 
among my sheep who have fallen asleep. How will you be able to awaken them if 
you have become complacent? You must have a heart that is burning with a 
desire for conversion. Especially for the conversion of your neighbor's hearts. Go 
out and offer council to those who have become lost. Pray for those who are 
indifferent to my love. Be ardent. Show everyone that you belong to me. 
Remember that I will remain with you so have faith. Courage comes from a heart 
that trusts. Know that you can place anything before me and I will place it within 
my Heart. Bring me your troubles. Give to me your trepidations.  Do not forget 
that I am mercy. Seek first the kingdom. Then everything else will follow. I have 
given you the knowledge. You must go out now and share what you have 
received. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
3/30/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
My mercy is for every child who comes to me and believes. Those who trust in 
me will not fear. They believe and already know the truth. I have not come to 
condemn you. I have come to redeem you. To put away what you have brought 
upon yourselves through your sins. I am the resurrection. Those who believe in 
me will have eternal life. Do not be fooled into thinking that you can remove what 
you have sown merely by giving an account of your wealth. Your lofty things will 
not save you. Only by trusting in me will you be saved. I am the light of the world. 
Do not be fooled into thinking you can remove the darkness you have allowed to 
permeate your world by saying I have done many good and noble deeds. Yes, 
you have works but only by believing in me will your works become blessed. I 
alone have laid down my life as justification for your sins. Do not be so arrogant 
to think that you can bring about change. What you sow without my grace will 
only be swept away just as the sea sweeps away it's treasurers. Be humble and 



believe that I have done what I have done because you are loved. This is the 
truth I wish for you to ponder. You are loved. Know this. I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. 
 

3/31/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and prepare your hearts for my coming. I ask each of you tonight 
to again peer into your hearts. Do you see that you are ready to come before 
me? When I ask you, if you have fed my sheep, what will you say?  If I ask you, 
have you clothed the naked, will you answer, "yes Lord". If I ask you, if you have 
sheltered the homeless or cared for the sick, will you answer me "yes."  I will 
come at an hour you do not know. Will you be ready or will you say to me, "Lord if 
only we had known the time of your coming we would have prepared." I ask this 
so you may prepare. I tell you the truth, I do not wish that you do these acts only 
to say, "look I have done what you told me." Your works will be empty. I desire for 
you to go out and love. Love with a heart that is compassionate. Live for each 
other so that all might see that you belong to me. I am mercy. Full of compassion. 
Look to me when you struggle. Come to me when you fall. My Heart is open and 
ready to pour out graces and mercy to all who ask. Do not be afraid of my 
coming but rejoice. No longer will you be a slave to sin. You will live in me and I 
will reside in you. Keep my commandments and you will gain treasure in Heaven. 
Everyone who hears my words and follows me will be my disciple. This I tell you. 
Anyone who denies himself and follows me will have eternal life. I myself will 
acknowledge him before my Heavenly Father and my Heavenly Father will 
reward him. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

4/1/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Become defenders of 
faith. Listen attentively to my Son. His words are truth. I love you and I give you 
my motherly blessings. 
  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Be patient with every day. Give from a heart that has offered 
everything to me. Especially when you have offered on behalf of your brother or 
sister. Give to those who have less. Offer comfort to the weak. Show kindness to 
the less fortunate. Give to those who have been difficult. I have loved each of you 
without judging whether you were first worthy. Had I judged mankind first, no one 
would have been redeemed. That is why I came first as a merciful savior. 



Forgiver of debts. You can also be a forgiver of debts towards your brothers and 
sisters. Be kind. Show mercy. Be willing to accept others forgiveness. When 
someone shows you sincerity, do not then say, "I only forgive you because you 
have pleased me." Forgive even those who have not asked or are worthy. If you 
are not willing to forgive them, what shall I say to you at judgement. Will I find you 
worthy and without blemish? Or will you say "Lord forgive me a sinner." Forgive 
while you have the ability to forgive. Love while you have the capability to love. 
Choose this freely because the day will come when you do not have the time or 
the choice. Do not be caught off guard. I tell you the truth those who you have 
refused to forgive will be the very ones who will testify against you. What words 
will you give me to reprove them? Do what you can do while it is still day outside. 
I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

4/2/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Renew your faith through me. I 
am the way. Anyone who comes to me will not be forsaken. I love you. It is my 
Good Day All: I am out of office on Monday, 8/19, returning on Tuesday. being told "no you 
cannot come." It is only by your own free will that you choose not to accept my 
mercy. You turn away from me and walk away. My Heart bleeds for the lost. How 
much I wish they would return to me and seek shelter in the chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. That is why I call out to you tonight. Love my 
children who have turned their hearts from me. Do not spurn them. My mercy is 
for all. I love you. Tonight, I wish to place in your own hearts an ardent desire for 
charity towards each other. Love begets love. Keep my words with you as you go 
out among my sheep. Practice patience. Practice charity. Give from your hearts 
and I will bless your efforts. The seeds you plant today will become tomorrow's 
harvest. Plant seeds of faith. Even among the weeds plant them. I can assure 
you some will take root and grow. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
  
4/3/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Chosen and cherished each child is to my Heavenly Father. Remain 
united to his will always. Take comfort in knowing that you are loved. There is no 
hierarchy in God's Heart. Every child is loved completely. I want you to 
understand that this means every child. Yes, even the children who are living in 
sin. Those who have been unwilling to change. Even those children who 
renounce their Father and my gift of salvation. Every child is loved. That is why 



you must learn to love as your Father in Heaven Loves. As I Love. Do not render 
judgement against your brother and declare him or her unfit to receive your love. 
What profit will you gain if you despise those who are loved. Pray for their hearts 
to transform. Pray that they will come to see how unique they are. Offer kindness. 
Be merciful. Remember what you do for your brothers and sisters I will place in 
my fourth chamber. Here is where your treasure is. Enter into my Heart through 
charitable deeds done with a loving heart. Then when you see the Son of man 
coming you will be ready to greet me with many fruits. I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
4/4/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children do not harbor 
anger in your hearts towards anyone. Be children who love. The more you show 
kindness and mercy the more you will receive kindness and mercy during 
judgement. Remember what my Son has told you. Do not judge lest you be 
judged. How you measure others will be the measure which will be allotted out to 
you. Love my little ones. Love and trust. I love you and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

4/5/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Bring to me your fears and I will place you in the shelter of my Heart. 
Bring to me your transgressions and I will forgive your sins. Bring to me your 
doubts and I will enkindle a fire within your soul. Remain united to my will. Then 
you will see clearly the truth. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
  
4/6/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my sheep and offer to each one mercy and 
compassion. Do not look first at outward appearance. Do not wait to see if they 
are kind in return. Go out and offer them your kindness. Treat everyone as if you 
were treating me. For these are my sheep. Go and feed them for they are hungry 
for truth. Go and give them shelter. Their souls have been wandering in the 
wilderness and need a place to rest. Go and give them drink for they are thirsty 
to be seen by those who despise them. Do not give expecting to be paid. Do not 
withhold because they have nothing to offer you. Give because you have 
received my words and have given me your yes. What you freely give will be 



seen by me and my Father in Heaven. Surely we will see what you have done 
and bless your efforts. I tell you the truth, any child who goes out in my name and 
even offers a morsel will be considered great and I shall place what you have 
done in my fourth chamber. Where neither moths nor rust can come and take 
away what you have received for your efforts. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/7/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Be faithful: prepare your hearts for my coming. Be steadfast: Do not 
fall prey to wickedness. Be courageous: Know that I am with you always. 
 

Give testimony by your actions. These are the teachings I give to you to ponder. 
Take a moment each day to contemplate my words. Then look within your heart 
to see if you are abiding in me. Do you take these teachings and sow them into 
your heart so that you may bear fruit? Or do you listen to them and forget them 
as soon as you return to your activities? Or do you listen and become indifferent 
choosing to remain as you are? Change from within has been the theme during 
these past few months. How you live these messages will bring about 
conversions or condemnation. (I see a group of people living the messages and 
showing love towards their neighbor. People begin to convert because of their 
actions. Then I see a group of people who stopped living the messages. They 
were not loving or being charitable towards their neighbor. Those neighbors 
would have converted but did not because they did not receive love. They 
remained sinful.) If you are sowing seeds of faith, remain in me as I in you. If you 
have become complacent, return to me so that I might enkindle a fire within you. 
If you have become indifferent, change. Return to the beginning. (of the 
messages) Know that you are loved. Chosen and cherished by your Heavenly 
Father. Created in his image and likeness. You have been redeemed through my 
sacrifice of love. Know that I gave up my life so that you may live. No longer are 
you a slave to sin. I have given you my Heart to reside in. Every chamber is like a 
door to grow closer in union with my divine will. So much has been given to you 
already. Yet I am not finished. I still have more to share with you. I wish to 
encourage you. To remind you how valuable you are. Do not fear me. I have not 
come to bring about division. I have come to bring you back to my Heart. To unite 
myself to you. Only through me can you enter paradise. I am the way. Those who 
knock upon my door will never be turned away. Come to me and I will shelter you 
in the abode of my Heart. You belong to me. Simply give me your yes. Those 
who believe in me will have eternal life. And I shall raise you up on the last day. I 
love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 



 

4/8/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. They are lost because they have 
allowed sin to take root in their hearts. They have become blinded to faith and 
have grown indifferent to me. I ask you to go out and live what you have 
received. Teach them courage by being courageous. Teach them charity by being 
charitable. Teach them about mercy by being merciful. Teach them love by 
showing them how to be selfless. Teach by example. If you wish to win over their 
hearts, you must first win over their indifferences. To do this you must be 
consistent in what you are saying. You cannot tell your brother "I love you" and 
then turn your back on them. Or tell them about my mercy and then be unwilling 
to forgive when they offend you. That is why you must give from your hearts. Last 
night I asked you to go back to the beginning if you were indifferent. To overcome 
indifference, you must return your hearts to me. You cannot say to your brother 
or sister, "you are indifferent towards The Lord, or you lack a zeal for the faith" if 
you are not willing to see your own lack of zeal or indifferences. Each of you has 
the opportunity to grow thereby bringing others with you. Change your own 
hearts first. Then go out and plant seeds among my lost sheep. Cultivate the soil 
through consistency. You will soon see fruit. Then when the harvest is ready you 
will bear much for the kingdom. I love you. Come and bring all of this to me and I 
will bless your efforts. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/9/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children make good 
use of the time you are receiving. Prepare your hearts for my Son through a daily 
renewal of your baptismal promises. Remember to avoid all occasions of sin. 
Especially that which could cause harm to others. I love you my little ones. Know 
that I am praying for you before the throne of God. Tonight I give you my 
motherly blessings and in a special way I place each of you under my mantle of 
motherly protection. Know this. 
  
4/10/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto mine. Come to me and do not delay. I love each of you with a heart that is 
merciful. Come to me and do not delay. I love you with a heart that is ready to 
receive you. Come and do not delay, my heart is open and ready to shelter you. I 
am mercy. In me you will find salvation. I did not come to condemn you. I came 



as a refuge for all men. I have come so that you may find peace. I love you. 
Inside the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart is a door that leads 
you to a deeper union with me. Come and follow me. I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/11/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. Again, tonight I ask you to go out and 
minister to those in need. They are my beloved. My mercy is especially for those 
who are struggling. Their hearts have become hardened and they have grown 
indifferent. Do not turn your backs away from these my lost sheep. I have loved 
them from the beginning. I bore everything for them. Now they rebuke my gifts. 
You may think they are undeserving of your affections. I love them. If you love me 
then love those whom the world wishes to throw away. My Heart is a vessel of 
mercy. A place of refuge for sinners. No child should be lost to me. I have 
ransomed my Heart for all. No one was excluded. Go out and sow seeds of love. 
Sow seeds of mercy. Sow seeds of kindness. Then come to me and place all of 
this at my feet. I love you and I will bless your efforts. Tonight I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/12/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. My Heart is a place of refuge for sinners. Come and abide in me. If you 
are uncertain of what you are to do for your brother or sisters, then love them. If 
you are afraid, then pray for them. If you have become unfavorable in your 
actions, repent. What you do today will be judged tomorrow, so act accordingly. A 
wise man loves first before anything else. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
  
4/13/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and begin anew. Do not let yesterday's difficulty set today's path. 
That is why I have come to forgive you. So, each of you may start again. If 
yesterday you chose to live as an adulterer or fornicator, you can be free of those 
sins today. You can walk with a heart that is pure. This is what forgiveness is. To 
begin anew. To no longer allow past mistakes set your future steps. If you stole, 
then give back what you have taken. Enter into the second chamber of my most 



Sacred and Merciful Heart. I will forgive you this debt so you can begin anew. If 
you are struggling to love do not be afraid. I will forgive this. Now go out and love 
everyone you meet. See that you treat them with kindness. Contemplate what 
you have heard tonight. Look inside your own heart. Where are your struggles? 
What have you been holding onto that is causing you great anguish? Give 
everything to me. I love you. For this reason, I have come. To set mankind free. 
Free from sin. Free from imprisonment. You are no longer a slave to sin. Now go 
out and begin anew. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
   
4/14/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come to me and do not delay. My Heart is an open vessel of graces ready 
to be poured out upon mankind for the forgiveness of sin. Grace and mercy. That 
is what I offer each of you tonight. These are my gifts. You only need to ask to 
receive. That is why tonight I ask each of you to come to me. Come and enter 
into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Those who come and 
enter my Heart will not be lost or forsaken. I will protect them just as a Shepherd 
protects his flock. Those who listen to my words and enters my Heart are my 
sheep. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/15/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. You have been chosen and cherished by your Father in Heaven. 
Redeemed by my blood. This is truth. This is what you must carry with you. Truth. 
Do not be fooled into thinking that what you wear matters. How you eat or whom 
you drink with. You belong to my Heart. My Heart has been pierced open for you. 
My love is everlasting. My mercy is endless. What you bring with you should be a 
desire for the salvation of souls. I ate and drank with sinners. The world thought 
of them as no longer deserving. They were my sheep. I loved them because my 
Father loved them since the beginning. I did not love them because they were 
lofty. I did not dine with them because they were wealthy. They were neither lofty 
nor wealthy. They were my sheep. They were lost and in need of healing. Now I 
desire to take each of you into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. To once again unite myself to you. Simply accept what I am asking of you. 
To give me your yes. To trust that I love you. To believe that you belong to my 
Heart. My Heart is not a place of condemnation. My Heart is a vessel of mercy. A 
place of refuge. A consolation to all who needs consoling. My Heart belongs to 
each of you because I too have loved you since the beginning.  You belong to 
me. I have paid your debts. I have cleansed your sins. It was through my eternal 



yes that mankind was once again united to their Creator.  No longer are you 
children exiled from God's Heart. You belong to us. Come to me and do not 
delay. Heaven awaits each of you. Give me your yes and I will place you in my 
first chamber. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/16/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and prepare your hearts for my coming. Go out among my lost 
sheep and give what you have received. Bring with you joy. Give mercy. Do not 
allow indifferences towards your brothers and sisters to plague your decisions to 
love them. Love them because I have loved you. They belong to my Heart 
because I have offered my Heart as a random for all. I did not only love those 
who loved me. I did not only love those who respected my decisions. I loved 
those who hated me. I loved those who despised me. I loved those who mocked 
me. My Heart was opened for all. No one has been excluded. So, I again tell 
each of you to go out and love. Bring joy wherever you trod. Become 
peacemakers. Live with great anticipation for my coming. You are my sheep and I 
am your Shepard. I love you and you listen to me because you know my words 
are truth. Do not fear my arrival. I hold each of you in the abode of my Heart. You 
belong to me.  I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/17/2014 
Holy Thursday 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and dwell in the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
My Heart is an open vessel. A place of refuge for sinners. Tonight, I ask each of 
you to take a walk with me. It is dark outside and the earth is damp. The ground 
is cold beneath my feet. I am praying for each of you. You are on my mind. I 
know that soon I will give everything for you. Nothing will remain. I will empty 
myself completely. This is what I want each of you to do also. Empty yourselves 
of your anger and hatred. Empty yourselves of your jealousy and trite. Do not 
allow indifference to take over in your hearts. Look at me as my hour 
approaches. I am not thinking of your sins.  I am not thinking about mankind's 
lack of faith. I remember that you were made in the image of my Father. You 
were created from the earth and life entered your spirit. (I see God breathing his 
spirit into Adam's nostrils, giving him life.) You were not just flesh and bones. You 
were children. Now my hour is approaching to restore that unity once again. 
Each step will be taken out of love. I have given everything for you. This I wish 
for you to know. This is how much I have loved you. Now come and dwell in the 



chambers of my Heart. You belong to me because I have loved you since the 
beginning. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/18/2014 
Good Friday 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Tonight, I wish to bring you into the chambers of my most Sacred 
and Merciful Heart. Within each chamber is an opportunity to draw closer to me. 
Give me your yes and I will place you in my first chamber. Here I will open your 
heart to my love and my sacrifice. I will open your eyes in a new way. My second 
chamber is for forgiveness. When you come to me with a contrite heart, I will 
wash away your iniquities and cleanse you of your many sins. My Heart was 
pierced open for this. In this chamber I will shelter you. I will offer you consolation 
as you begin to grieve. You are not lost to me. For this I have come so that you 
might be forgiven. Now child you have been washed clean in the blood of my 
sacrifice. Our hearts have become one because you have resided in me. My third 
chamber hears your prayers. No prayer is lost. No prayer goes unnoticed or 
unheard. I see your concerns. I see how often these petitions weigh heavily on 
you. This chamber is a place of great contemplation. Now you have come to 
listen. Quiet your soul and I will guide you. I will take your prayers and help guide 
you. Just as a parent guides their small child. Whatever you ask of me I will grant 
in this chamber if what you ask conforms to my will. I love you. I tell you this 
because your wants are not always what you will need. How often a child asks 
for something that will cause harm. Sometimes their wants could impede other’s 
chance for growth. Trust in my love. Trust in me. My fourth and final chamber I 
offer to each of you. This chamber is where I hold everything you have offered 
me. Every good deed. What you have sown you have sown in my Heart. I see 
your efforts and I will reward you. You have loved. This chamber holds all charity. 
Everything you have done for the least to the greatest is remembered and you 
will be rewarded for your efforts. Reside in me as I reside in you. Come and enter 
into my Heart. My Heart is a place of refuge for sinners and a door that leads to 
salvation. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

4/19/2014 
Holy Saturday 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Tonight, I ask each of you to come and enter into the chambers of my 
Most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart is a vessel of graces. You only need to 



ask and you shall receive. Come to me and do not delay. I love you. You belong 
to my Heart. Everything I have offered to my Father on your behalf. Now come 
and rejoice with me. I have come into the world so that you might be saved. No 
longer are you a slave to sin. I love you. Take what I am offering you. My body 
which is true food. My blood which is true drink. Come and eat. What you do 
today will be remembered always. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
 
4/20/2014 
Easter Sunday 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and rejoice. Unite yourself to me through the chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. I have loved you since the beginning. You 
belong to my Heart. Come and enter my feast that has been prepared since the 
beginning of time. You are all welcomed. Only by your own free will do you 
remain outside. Do not be afraid. I love you. Just as I have told you my Heart is a 
vessel of graces. My Heart is also a bounty of graces ready to be poured out 
upon mankind. Come and rejoice with me. I have come to set your hearts on fire. 
I am the Lamb that was slain for the sins of mankind. Now I come as the risen 
savior ready to come and bring each of you with me to my eternal home. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
4/21/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and prepare your hearts for my coming. Go out among my lost 
sheep and give them what you have received. Again, I tell you whatsoever you 
do for the least of these you have done for me. I shall reward your efforts. Do not 
benefit from other’s misfortunes. Go and offer aid to those who have been 
struggling. Surely your brother and sister are worth more than your things. Do not 
take advantage of the downtrodden. They are my sheep and they belong to me. I 
tell you the truth anyone who suffers for my sake will receive much. Give freely 
so that you are not expecting recompense. Be forthright with your speech so that 
you may be believed. This is how you are to win over the hearts of mankind. 
Love one another. That is why I am still here. (Teaching us tonight) To bring you 
closer to my Heart. To immerse you in my love so that you may go out and 
spread what you have received. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
  



4/22/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be eager to 
live out my Son's teachings. Become joyful witnesses of the gospels. In your 
everyday tasks glorify God by working earnestly to please him. Be truthful. Be 
prudent. Never give testimony against your brother that will cause him undue 
harm. Especially if your testimony is false in nature. If your brother has done a 
wrongful act or slandered someone correct him with gentle words. Be kind. 
Malice will not bring about fruits. Only through love can a soul be converted. 
Children, I love you. Tonight I place each of you under my mantle of motherly 
love. Know this. 
  
4/23/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Take what I am teaching you and grow. Do not remain stagnant in 
your faith. If you love me, you will follow my teachings because you know my 
words are truth. Love one another. Everything comes from this singular 
command. When you learn to love, you will learn to forgive. When you learn to 
love, you will have patience. Love abounds. Especially when your love comes 
united to the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. I have loved you 
from the beginning. Now I give you this command. Go out and love. Be 
peacemakers. Sow forgiveness. Be merciful just as I am merciful. Then when I 
come in all of my glory, I will find you hard at work. You will be mine and belong 
to my Heart. This I will place in the book of life. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

4/24/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Begin anew. Do not look upon your past sins and think I am 
unwilling to forgive you. Do not look at your current struggles and believe that 
you are unworthy of my mercy. I love you. My mercy and forgiveness are yours. I 
understand that you are weak. I already know that you easily fall into temptation. 
That is why I carried my cross. Each step was out of love for you. Every step was 
a prayer to my Father on your behalf. You are always in my Heart. You need to 
begin to trust this. So that is why I tell you to begin anew. Let this change begin in 
your heart. Stop talking and simply listen. I love you. I did not come to condemn 
you or put you to shame. I see you are hurting. I understand how difficult your 
crosses can be to carry. That is why I am telling you to listen to me. I love you. 
Tonight, I once again give you my Heart. Every chamber is open and ready to 
receive you. I only desire to unite myself to you. To free you from the chains that 



you have kept close to your heart. You do not belong to those chains. They do 
not need to lead you. I am the way. I am truth. I am the giver of life. All who 
believe in me will not see death. I have overcome this world so rejoice. You 
belong to my Heart. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

4/25/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children tonight I wish 
to teach you the virtue of obedience. My little one’s obedience helps the soul to 
be in uniformity with the holy will of God. It is when you disobey that you no 
longer remain in union with him. The more you become disobedient to God's 
laws the easier it will be for you to fall into mortal sin. My little ones. God loves 
each of you. He does not wish for you to fall away from his Heart. He is all 
forgiving. He is all merciful. Do not abuse his love. Teach your little ones the 
importance of this virtue. Remember to teach by example. I love you my little 
ones. Know this. Tonight I give you my motherly blessings. 
 

4/26/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
onto myself. Go and bring my words to those around you. Do not carry my words 
with a difficulty or heaviness. Bring my words with a joyful countenance. 
Remember that what you give, you will also receive, so have hearts that are 
joyful. When you go out, do not seek only those who are less fortunate. Even the 
wealthy have need of my words. Do not believe that you have the power to 
change others. You have only the power to change from within. Everything else is 
my grace. Let your own words be truthful. Let your motives be sincere. Be 
honest. Be selfless. Always refusing to take something when you have received 
without cost. Remember what you do in darkness will be revealed by the light. I 
love you. Tonight I ask each of you to go and deliver my messages of love to 
those around you. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

 

 

4/27/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. No one should be lost to my Heart.  
They are lost because they have wandered away from me. They have forgotten 
how much I have loved them. They have been negligent in their faith. Now they 



think I have forgotten them. I tell you the truth. No one has been forgotten. I have 
laid down my life for all. No one has been excluded. My mercy is for all. Just as 
my gift of salvation is for all. You only need to trust in my mercy. Believe in me. I 
am the resurrection. I am the manna that has come down from Heaven. Those 
who believe in me shall have eternal life. Listen to my words. They are truth. I 
love you. My Heart is a vessel of mercy. Each chamber is a door that leads you 
into a deeper union with me. So many graces come from each chamber. You only 
need to enter. Your yes is what I am asking for. When you give me your yes you 
are knocking on the door to my Heart. I will open my door and invite you in. Here 
you will never hunger or thirst again. My mercy is for this generation. Believe me 
when I say to you, you only need to ask and it shall be granted. My Heart is open 
and ready to pour out an ocean of graces to those who ask. Now go out and take 
what I have told you and offer it to my lost sheep. What you do for the least of 
these I shall remember in my fourth chamber. I love you and tonight I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this.  
  
4/28/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. My Heart is a vessel of graces ready to pour out upon mankind. Come and 
receive what I have offered to you. I love you. You belong to my Heart. Within 
each chamber is a place to grow and be nourished. My Heart is a place of 
refuge. Fear not. Even the most hardened of sinners has a place in my Heart. No 
one is excluded. You only need to knock and the door will be answered. Anyone 
who comes with a trusting heart and asks for forgiveness will not be turned away. 
I will take that soul and place them in my second chamber. I will wash away their 
iniquities and cleanse them of their sins. I shall pour out my mercy upon them 
and dress them in the robes of redemption. They will be called children and they 
will appear before the throne of God. I shall proclaim them as my own. Any child 
who seeks my mercy will not be left astray. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

4/29/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming. Do not labor tirelessly without first producing 
fruits. Ask for my blessings. Seek my graces and all of this you shall obtain. Then 
when you work your efforts will be rewarded. You will be known by your fruits. 
Many work in vain trying to produce this result or grow that yield. I tell you the 
truth, without my blessings their work is in vain. They only wish to glorify 



themselves. How will this benefit their eternal soul? Seek my blessings in 
everything. Then when you work, your efforts will be seen, and you will grow 
much for the kingdom. I love you. Tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know 
this. 
 

4/30/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming. Enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and 
Merciful Heart by giving me your yes. Go and receive each other with hearts that 
are selfless and pure. Do not receive your neighbor with an attitude of 
vindication. Do not be filled with a heart that is prideful. Instead receive each 
other with kindness and warmth. Be generous with your affections. Remember 
everyone belongs to my Heart. No one has been excluded. Receive each other 
with a joyful disposition. Then when I come, I will see your efforts and reward 
you. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
5/1/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep. Bring to them acts of kindness. Foster 
a relationship of compassion and truth. Show mercy as I have offered mercy. 
Teach them about the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. It is by 
way of my chambers that souls will be saved. Each night bring everything to me, 
so I may bless your efforts. Nothing you do will be in vain if you offer everything 
to me. Even the smallest deed or sacrifice will be rewarded. I will place all in my 
fourth chamber. Know this. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. 
 

5/2/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Take heed to what I am telling you tonight. Do not become 
despondent during your trials. Too often you forgo grace and rely solely on your 
own strength. So many opportunities to earn treasure are lost because you failed 
to see the graces available with each trial. I love you. When you receive a cross 
to carry know that it is for your growth. Sometimes crosses are given so others 
may earn treasure. Love is what is lacking. So to is trust. Surrender everything to 
my will. Know that I am always with you. Guiding you and helping you to grow in 
wisdom and grace. I love you. Tonight, I desire for you to grow in faith. Take 
every opportunity to grow in virtue. Even if those opportunities come with a 
burden or sorrow. I myself will take care of your soul. Remember my Heart is a 



place of refuge. Seek solace in me. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

5/3/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Be faithful to the 
lessons you are receiving. Show a desire to change the areas of your life where 
you still remain unfaithful to The Lord. Encourage those around you to gently and 
patiently remove the hurts that they have been carrying with them. Their hearts 
are troubled. Trust in my Son. He is truth. All justice and mercy can be found in 
him. He is truth. I love you my little ones. Tonight I place each of you under my 
mantle of motherly love. Know this. 
 

5/4/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children become 
charitable towards your brothers and sisters. When you offer your efforts do not 
remind them of what you have done. Do not look for praises or a return of favors. 
Simply give because you love. Let what you have done be for the glory of God. 
That my little ones is your reward. I love you and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Remove the obstacles that you 
have allowed to remain in your hearts. You have sown greed instead of charity. 
You have sown jealousy because your hearts are full of pride. I tell you this day 
you must be fruitful and sow love. By your actions I will judge you. Let not your 
deeds cause you to become ill willed towards your brothers and sisters. 
Remember they are mine. They belong to my Heart. Love them as I have loved 
you. Show kindness even when they are tepid in their reception of your offerings. 
Patience is a virtue you must work on. Ask for my graces to help you as you learn 
what is truly necessary. To become my disciple you must deny yourself, pick up 
your cross and follow me. I am the way. No one will enter the kingdom without 
first entering through me. I am the door that leads to salvation. Remember this. I 
love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this.  
 

5/5/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children encourage 
each other. Learn to recognize each other's attributes. Understand that everyone 



has flaws. Each of you will struggle at one time with a certain vice. Do not 
condemn each other. Do not judge each other's actions. One day my Son will 
come and judge each person according to his or her deeds. That is why I now 
ask you to live holy lives. Encourage your brothers and sisters to set an example 
of compassion and mercy for all. Be constant in your affections towards each 
other and be forgiving. Just as my Son forgives all of your misgivings. Show that 
same kindness to each other. I love you my little ones. I pray for your continued 
conversions. Especially your ability to be forgiving. I love you and I give you my 
motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/6/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
My Heart is a refuge for all sinners. Do not become weary of the road ahead. Do 
not take on all sufferings and hardships without first coming to me. I have told 
you that I myself will come and help lift your burdens. Trust in my mercy. Do not 
be afraid to ask for assistance. That is why you have each other. Accept when 
someone offers you assistance. Then remember to return the kindness. Love 
begets love. Remember this. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
 

5/7/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Bring souls to the door of my Heart. If they knock I will surely answer 
and invite them in to dine with me. I am the bread of life who has come to take 
away the sins of mankind through my sacrifice. I did not lay down my life to 
condemn you. I laid down my life so that you might live through me. I came to 
save each of you. To bring you back in union with the Father. I love you. Bring 
souls to the door of my Heart. Believe me when I tell you that my Heart is a 
vessel of mercy for all sinners. You only need to ask and trust in my mercy. 
Whoever asks will receive and I shall place them in the chambers of my most 
Sacred and Merciful Heart. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know 
this. 
 

5/8/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to random your hearts 
unto myself. Go and prepare your hearts for my coming. Do not allow yourselves 
to be caught off guard. Do not waste this time you are receiving. Many graces 



are being libated for the sins of mankind. Many gifts are being offered to those 
who are in need of my mercy. Go out and begin to listen. See all that I have given 
to you. Rejoice and be glad. I am coming to separate my sheep from the goats. 
Prepare ahead of time while it is still daylight. Night is coming when no one will 
work. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
5/9/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my heart. 
Renew your trust in me by living faithfully each day. Begin anew and begin to 
bear fruit for the kingdom. It is by way of your yes that others will see your light. 
They will see that you have changed. Let your light be a reminder to the world 
that you belong to me. You are mine. You do not belong to this world. You belong 
to my Heart. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/10/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My 
Heart is a vessel of graces ready to pour out upon mankind. Again, I come 
tonight to remind you that you are to prepare for my coming. Remain in me as I 
remain in you. This is how you are to remain in me. Keep my commandments. 
Give to those whom I have sent you. Do not allow yourselves to become troubled 
by what the world is telling you. You do not belong to this world. You are mine. 
Remember this. Do not forsake what I have given to you. Do not go out and 
condemn those whom I have given to you. Teach with love. Give from your 
hearts. Let your yes mean yes. Let your no be just that. Let your words speak 
truth. Then they will not be judged for being dishonest. Remember that I love 
you. It is my desire that you remain in me. Take shelter in the abode of my Heart. 
My Heart belongs to all because I have freely given it to all. I love you and tonight 
I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
5/11/2014  
Children, it is your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Go out and renew your 
baptismal promises. Love one another just as my Son has commanded you. 
Children you long for peace and still cause war. Your lack of love and mercy is 
your strongest barrier to this. Love one another. Forgive when you have lacked 
charity. This my little ones is necessary if you wish to restore peace again in your 
families and your nations. I love you. Tonight I wish to place each of you under 
my mantle of motherly love. Know this. 



 

 
 
5/12/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly mother, my dear little ones. Children become 
witnesses to my Son's teachings. His words are truth. Go out and sow peace. 
Always remembering the goodness of God. My little ones do not forget how 
quickly you can become lost. There are many deceits laid out as traps. The devil 
only wishes to distract you by confusing you. Stay close to my Son's Heart. Be 
ready to forgive everyone just as my Son has forgiven you. Then he will find not 
fault with you because you will have loved just as he commanded you. I love you 
my little ones and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/13/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Again, I come tonight to ask you if you are prepared for my coming. 
Have you looked closely at your choices? Are you living according to the 
messages you have been receiving? If the answer is no, then I ask you to reflect 
on why. What is keeping you from following me? If you are steadfast in what you 
are keeping close to your heart, then why do you refuse to heed what I am telling 
you. Listen to what you are saying. Are your conversations pure and without 
profanity? Are you speaking truth or have you forgotten what I have said about a 
deceitful tongue? You must listen to what I am now saying. Those who continue 
down the road of perdition will surely be lost when I come. Believe me when I tell 
you I see your efforts. Do not hinder any child who is trying to live justly. Instead 
encourage them. Remember every child is loved. No one is excluded from my 
Heart. Live the lessons you are receiving. Do not think you still have tomorrow to 
begin. Begin now while it is still daylight. Night is coming then no one will work. I 
love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/14/2013  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare for my coming. Each night I come to open your hearts to my 
words. Yet some of you listen and then quickly forget what I have said. Your 
choices do not reflect what I have taught you. Begin anew tonight. Listen with an 
open heart and a steady mind. Try not to become distracted. Instead take a 
moment each day to remind yourself exactly what you are doing. Are your 
actions mimicking what you have heard? Are you following my teachings? Do not 



be caught off guard. I love you. Prepare for my coming by listening to my words. 
Then take and sow what you have received. I love you and tonight I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
 
5/15/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Give your hearts to one another. Then you will be able to forgive 
more freely. How can you go out and proclaim me if you are not willing to live by 
my standards? If I forgive your sins, then why do you withhold forgiveness from 
others? You are not living by the commandments. If you wish to proclaim my 
teachings, if you wish to be my disciple, you must go out among my sheep and 
be merciful. You must show compassion. You must forgive everyone that has 
offended you. Then when I come in all of my glory, I will call out to you. I will 
proclaim your name in Heaven. I will proclaim you as my own because you have 
followed my teachings. Out of love for your brothers and sisters, you have loved 
me, because I reside in them. Those who obey my will are my disciples and I 
shall raise them up on the last day. Remember this. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/16/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my lost sheep and teach them about the chambers of 
my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart is a vessel of compassion for 
sinners. Too often you judge another's actions already sentencing them without 
mercy or compassion. Yet you wish to receive mercy and compassion for your 
own grave failings. Change your own hearts first. Then you will see the 
importance of not judging other’s actions. Love one another this is what I ask of 
you tonight. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/17/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be fruitful with 
the graces you are receiving. I love you my little ones. Take each day and spend 
time with my Son. Even for a moment contemplate his sacrifice that he offered to 
his Father on your behalf. Recognize that his love for you is what brought him 
through each grueling step. Children you will not be able to understand this gift or 
how this gift has redeemed you if you never contemplate it. Children take time 
listening to your Heavenly Father. He is always with you. You are his and you 



belong to his Heart. My little ones I can only intercede on your behalf. You must 
accept what is being given to you. Whether you are enduring trials or graces you 
are loved. Know this. I love you my little ones and I give you my motherly 
blessings. 
 
 
5/18/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children become 
ardent with your prayers. When you pray really try to ask yourself if you are 
praying out of habit or are you trying to become closer to God. Are your prayers 
said with love. Do you try to focus on what you are asking for. I know my little 
ones that prayers can be difficult at time. But remember how important prayer is. 
You begin to reconcile your hearts when you pray with charity. When your 
motives are selfless your prayers will become fruitful. I love you my little ones. 
Pray from your hearts. Then every prayer will earn merit. I love you and I give 
you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/19/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. My Heart is a vessel of graces ready to be poured out upon mankind. Who 
among you will receive what I am offering you? To receive such graces, you must 
accept what I am saying. Those who accept my words are also accepting my will 
for them, and my will is this: that you obey my commandments. That you accept 
everything with certainty, because it is I who place both the graces and trials 
among you. Every thorn is attached to a beautiful rose. Trials will exist to a 
certain degree. Struggling with this burden is acceptable. I love you. Go now and 
pray for my coming. Gird yourself with truth. I myself will lead you. I love you and 
I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/20/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children become good 
stewards with the gifts you are receiving. Do not take this time for granted. Offer 
each moment to my Son. Then your works will be fruitful. I love you my little 
ones. Tonight begin to increase your prayer life by reading the scriptures. 
Regular reading will teach you how to grow in holiness. Children it is important to 
read sacred scripture to your children. Children learn by example. I love you my 
little ones and I pray for your continued conversions. Know this. 



 

5/21/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be faithful to 
my Son's teachings. They are truth. Children you must become steadfast with 
your prayers. You are often too eager to finish, or your hearts are distant. Return 
to the beginning. Start again. Each time make an effort to pray from your heart. 
Even if you can only spend a small time before The Lord give him your whole 
heart. Then your heart will be his. Faith will grow from prayers that are said with 
hearts focused on pleasing The Lord. Whenever you pray keep in mind all that 
my Son has offered on your behalf. Then your heart will grow in gratitude. You 
will see that your prayers will grow not only in volume but more importantly in 
substance. I love you my little ones and I give you my motherly blessings. Know 
this. 
 

5/22/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children keep holy the 
sabbath. Remember that this was a command given by God. You are to keep his 
day holy because you will grow in union with him. Now you are to keep holy the 
Lord’s Day. Remembering how much my Son loved each of you. How he 
sacrificed his life so that you may have life within him. Children it is important that 
you begin to take seriously what you have been given. Do not fall asleep. Begin 
to renew your gifts from my Son by following his words. Obey the 
commandments. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/23/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children practice 
virtues every day. Be kind to each other. Refrain from using harsh words or an 
arrogant demeanor. Instead look for my Son in everyone you meet. Try to focus 
on each other's gifts. Everyone has been given a gift from God. Just as each 
child must also carry a cross or endure a trial. Remain positive around others and 
remember to be a source of love and mercy. Practice patience when you become 
distressed. Children, learning to love each other teaches you how to become 
selfless. You learn what love is and the value of sacrificing. In order to prepare 
your hearts for my Son you must begin to practice using the virtues. Especially 
the virtue of charity. I love you my little ones and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

5/24/2014  



Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. You who are listening, keep my word within you. Then you shall 
have peace. Go out among my sheep and teach them about my mercy. It is 
within the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart that mercy exists. My 
Heart is a vessel of mercy waiting to deliver those who have not kept my word 
but have an ardent desire to be with me. My Heart is a vessel of grace ready to 
be poured out upon those who have listened but soon grow weary and return to 
their former selves. It is these souls that I have come to take back unto myself. 
They are not lost to me but merely asleep. Now is the time for all to return to my 
Heart. Come and dwell with me for I am meek and humble of heart. I love you 
and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/25/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. I love you. It is out of this love, that I desire for you to enter the 
chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart is a vessel of graces 
ready to be poured out upon mankind. Go out among my lost sheep and become 
a light for them. Let the world know that you belong to my Heart. They will know 
you are mine when they see your light. Many graces I will bestow upon you so 
you can light the way. I am the good Shepard. Anyone who hears my voice and 
follows me are my sheep. I know my sheep and they follow me. This is because I 
am truth. Darkness fears the light because their deeds will be seen. Live in the 
light so that everything you do will be in the light and all will see your deeds and 
know that you belong to me. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

5/26/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Go out among my lost sheep and 
bring them mercy. Shower them with acts of kindness and charity. What you do 
for your brothers and sisters you do for me and I will place your efforts in my 
fourth chamber. Give from your hearts. Give to those who lack what is necessary 
for life. Food. Shelter. Forgiveness. Mercy. All of these are necessary. To withhold 
from your brother or sister is a lack of charity. Look within your own heart and 
decide if you are truly being charitable. Remember the theme has been change 
from within. You must not forget that it is necessary to evaluate your own actions 
first before you cast judgement on another. How can you find faults with your 
brother if you are unwillingly to look within? First look at your own motivations. 
Then you will better be able to understand someone else's. I love you. Now go 



and seek out my lost sheep. Love them and bring them to the chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. If they knock surely I will let them in. I love you 
and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/27/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Study the scriptures. 
Learn about my Son. He is truth. My little ones the more you get to know my Son 
the sooner you will become ready with an open heart to greet him. He loves each 
of you. What he did has been recorded. Read about my Son with your families. 
Then take what you have learned and live that lesson. Try to emulate my Son as 
you go out among your brothers and sisters. I love you my little ones. I 
encourage you to pray and fast from those things that keep you from drawing 
closer to my Son. I love you my little ones and I pray for renewed prayer in your 
homes and within your families. Know this. 
 

5/28/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be faithful 
witnesses to my Son's teachings. His words are truth. I love you my little ones. 
Take heart. This time of trials will not last. Soon my Son will come. Accept this 
time and trust in my Son. Give him all of your daily works for him to bless. Then 
your efforts will not be in vain. My little ones, make good use of this time of grace. 
The time of God's judgement will come. That is why my little ones I ask you to 
make good use of this time. Ask my Son for the gift of discernment. Ask for the 
gifts of understanding and counsel. Then make good use of these gifts. Go out 
and teach those who have remained distant from my Son. Teach with kindness 
and by example. Children do not be afraid. You are never alone. My Son is with 
you. All of Heaven is praying and your Angels are here to assist you. Have faith 
and trust in my Son. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/29/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and renew your faith by keeping my commandments. You are to 
love your Father with all of your heart, all of your thoughts and all of your soul. 
Then likewise, you are to love your brother and sister just as I have loved you. 
This is what I have given you. To go out among my lost sheep and teach them of 
my mercy by being merciful. Teach them about forgiveness by forgiving. Teach 
them charity by being charitable. Teach them about my love by loving them. 
Teach by example. Then they will know that what you are teaching is just 



because it is from me that I send you out. Not from your own needs but from a 
willingness to obey what I have asked of you. Now go and proclaim what you 
have heard. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/30/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Be persistent with your 
prayer lives. Especially when it comes to reading sacred scripture. Be comforted 
in knowing that all of Heaven is praying for you. My little ones much rejoicing 
occurs when one child gives his heart to God. There is much to celebrate. Once 
this child was lost and far from home. Now because of many prayers, graces, 
and examples this child is born again. They are no longer lost to God's Heart. 
They have become united by faith with the certainty of salvation. Yes, my little 
ones. Have faith and trust in my Son. A child who believes is a cause for joy and 
celebration. Keep this on your hearts as you go out among your brothers and 
sisters who are still asleep. Pray for them, love them, and set a good example for 
them. This my children is what family is all about. I love you my little ones and I 
give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

5/31/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming by accepting my words into your heart. To live 
these messages is to bear witness to them. I have said to forgive as I have 
forgiven you. To be merciful just as I have been merciful. Now go and practice 
what you have heard. When someone insults you forgive them. When they say 
unkind things towards you show them mercy. I tell you the truth the kinder you 
are to your brothers and sisters, the more you will resemble me. Practice charity 
by giving from your heart. Have I not said what you give you shall receive tenfold 
in return? So, give from your hearts. Will I not reward you?  Go out among my 
lost sheep and love them. Every soul is entitled to my mercy. Show them what 
mercy is by being merciful. Then when I come in all of my glory I shall call each 
one forth. I will demand an account from you. What will you render me. If you 
love those, I have sent you, you will receive your recompense. But if you love 
those who have come because they were lost and you comforted them. They 
were hungry and you fed them. Thirsty and you gave them something to drink. 
Sick and imprisoned and you visited them. Homeless and you let them in. Surely, 
I tell you, you will belong to me and I will testify on your behalf before all. What 
you have done for the least you have done for me. Now you have loved. For this 
I shall place you in the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 



 

6/1/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. I love you my little 
ones. Carefully listen to what I am saying. My children wars would end and 
peace would again be restored if you would believe. Not just by word alone but 
with hearts on fire. Believe in my Son. He is truth. I love you and I give you my 
motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/2/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming, by removing those things that remove you from 
my Heart. Choose wisely when faced with more than one option. Remember that 
you belong to my Heart. Do not forsake everything by choosing against me. 
Vices, evil pleasures, untruths. All of these will cause you to fall easily into sin, so 
choose wisely. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/3/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare your hearts for my coming by removing everything that is causing 
you to wander from me. My love is for each of you. Just as my mercy is for every 
child. No one has been excluded. So do not fear coming to me. Even if you have 
sinned a hundred fold is my love not greater? Did I not die for you so that you 
might be saved? The answer is yes. So why do you still fear coming to me. My 
Heart is truly a vessel of graces. My love is eternal. Understand that you are not 
capable of removing yourself from my Heart. Yes, you sin. Even when you sin, I 
still love you. You can even choose to leave me. Abandon my mercy and my gift 
of salvation. But you always remain in my Heart. That is how much I love you. 
Now go and be at peace. Nothing you tell me will cause me to stop loving you. 
Ask for my mercy and it shall be granted to you. Your debts will be forgiven you 
when you trust in me. Trust that what I say to you now is truth. I love you. My 
mercy is endless just as my love is eternal. For this reason, I came into the world. 
Not to condemn mankind, but to forgive him. My blood is the covenant that I offer 
to you. I am the way the truth and the life. No one can enter into Heaven except 
through me. But remember I am gentle of Heart. Go and love as I have instructed 
you. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/4/2014 



Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children remember 
that you are greatly loved, especially during these times where much hatred and 
division exists. My little ones do not belong to this darkness. You only need to 
trust in my Son. He is light. His mercy will overshadow every injustice. He will 
bring peace to those who believe in him. My little ones love each other and do 
not cause division. When you are confronted with hatred and anger remain at 
peace and pray. Ask for the intercession of your Heavenly Angel. Pray that the 
Holy Spirit will help guide your actions. In particular how you speak. Keep your 
words simple and with a kindness. My little ones do not allow anger to enter your 
heart. Stay close to my Son. Especially through the Eucharist. You belong to his 
Heart. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/5/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go and prepare your hearts for my coming. Be fruitful with the time 
you have been given. This is a time of grace. My mercy is with you. Soon I will 
come as the just judge. Then you will come before me and I shall ask an account 
from you. What shall you tell me? Where are your treasures? What have you 
done with the talents I have given you? Surely you did not just bury them in the 
sand. Even a thief could do that. I have sent you out among the wolves to gather 
my lost sheep. Where are the ones I have given to you? These are the questions 
I shall be asking. Look into your hearts and see how you will answer me. I love 
you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Pray that you do not 
fall asleep. Pray that you are not caught off guard. I love you my little ones and I 
am placing each of you under my mantle of motherly love. Know this. 
 

6/6/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children do not 
become discouraged. When you pray begin by first reciting the Lord's prayer. 
Then ask your Heavenly Father to help you remember what is important. Ask for 
his blessings and ask the Holy Spirit to fill you with grace. Turn to my Son with 
contrite hearts and ask for his forgiveness. Trust in his mercy and always 
remember that above all you are loved. My little ones you forget this very 
important fact. God loves you. Because of his great and everlasting love for you 
he sent his only Son to free you from your sins. Children all of Heaven is 
continually praying for you. You are never without prayer. That is why I ask you to 



also pray. Pray from your hearts and pray for each other. When you pray you join 
the multitudes in Heaven. Children rejoice and be glad! I love you and I give you 
my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/7/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
Begin anew. Remember each moment you have a new chance to begin again. 
You are not bound by your past just as you have not yet received your future. You 
only have the present moment. It is in this moment that I wish for you to ask for 
my mercy. Give to me everything and I will bless your efforts. I love you. 
Remember this. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children pray from 
your hearts. Pray until prayer becomes a joy for you. Tonight I place each of you 
under my mantle of motherly love. Know this. 
 

6/8/2014  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Pray from your hearts. 
My little ones you must learn that prayer is not only an opportunity to spend time 
with God, it is also an opportunity to help your brothers and sisters. When you 
pray for others you are performing an act of charity. This my little ones is how you 
grow and develop into children of The Lord. God is Love. When you pray for your 
brothers and sisters you are showing God that you are also loving. Children 
prayer is an outward act of love. That is why you need to pray from your hearts. 
Then your prayers will become acts of love. I love you my little ones. I am praying 
before the throne of God for each of you. Know this. 
 

6/9/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Look within your hearts. There lies your truth. How you treat others. The 
words you speak. All of this defines who you are. It is not the clothes you wear or 
the value of your household that will define you. Who you are can be seen by 
how you treat those whom I have sent you. If you are kind and charitable, then 
you are a kind and charitable person. If you maltreat others and blaspheme 
against them, then who have you become? Change your hearts from within by 
repenting of your failings. Especially your transgressions towards your neighbor. 



What you have done to the least of these my Father's children, you have done 
unto me. Ask for my forgiveness and you shall receive it. Ask for mercy and 
mercy shall be yours. What you receive you are to go out and give. Then the gifts 
(talents) you have received will not be wasted. You will return unto me tenfold 
and I shall reward your efforts. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
 

6/10/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming. If you wish to reside in my chambers you must 
first open your heart to my will. My will is this, that you love each other as I have 
loved you. No one has a greater love than to offer one's own life. This I have 
given to each of you. I love you. Now you must look into your own chambers and 
decide if you are ready to love me. To love me you must follow my 
commandments. Bring about change first within your own heart. Then how you 
treat those whom I have sent to you. If you love me then you will love those 
whom I have given to you because they also reside in me. Love each other. Then 
you will reside in me and I in you. This I tell you, those who keep my words and 
follow me are my sheep and I will raise them up on the last day. I love you and I 
give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/11/14  
Children, it is I your Heavenly mother, my dear little ones. Children remember 
how important it is to read scripture in your homes. When you open scripture you 
are opening the Sacred word of God who is all good. Teach your children by 
example. During this time when there is so much evil, God will protect you 
through his words. My little ones remember just how important God's words are. 
How he made each of you by speaking the words "let us make man". Take this 
time to truly open your hearts and your childrens to love God by keeping his 
words with you. I love you my little ones. I am praying for each of you before the 
throne of God. Know this. Tonight I give you my motherly blessings. 
 

6/12/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children keep your 
family always together by faithfully reading scripture. Pray for discernment 
especially when dealing with difficulties. My little ones satan is active trying to 
destroy families. He wishes to separate you from God by causing discord. He 
wants you to believe that God no longer loves you. Children this is not true. God 
so loves you that he gave you his only Son, Jesus.  He lifts up the lowly and 



brings down the arrogant. Do not be afraid. God loves each child with an 
everlasting love. Trust my little ones. I love you and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
6/13/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Remove everything that you have 
placed (in your hearts) that is not within my will for you. Remove your doubts. 
Remove your fears. Do not allow temptation to enter your hearts. Instead come 
to me and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. When 
you accept my will, you are giving me your yes, thereby entering into the first 
chamber of my Heart. It is my peace I wish to give you. Know this. I love you and 
I give you my priestly blessings. 
 

6/14/14 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. It is by 
way of my chambers that souls will be saved. My Heart is a vessel of mercy. A 
place of refuge for sinners. Here you will come and be nourished. Your sins will 
be washed clean. No longer will you wander aimlessly. You are not lost. You 
belong here in the chambers of my Heart. When you enter into my Heart you 
reside in me and I am with you. You only need to seek to find. Ask and it shall be 
given to you. Knock and the door will be opened. For anyone who knocks upon 
the door to my Heart will surely find the door opened. I say this because those 
who knock upon the door to my Heart belong to me and they have come to find 
salvation. They have not come in vain. I myself will let them in. Any child who 
trusts in me will find the door to my Heart opened. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
6/15/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Look at what you have 
surrounded yourself with. That is where you have placed your treasure. You have 
allowed your hearts to become clouded with things and have forgotten to clear a 
path for me. Remove what you do not need. Anger, jealousy, greed, slothfulness. 
These have become your vices. The longer you allow them into your heart the 
sooner they will begin to take root in your soul. Repent and return to me who is 
all forgiving. I will help you turn your vices into virtues. You need to build strong 



faith by first believing in me. Then by practicing charity among your brothers and 
sisters. Charity brings forth love. Compassion. Humility. This is what you are to fill 
your hearts with. Make a path for me in your hearts and I will enkindle them with 
the flames of love. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/16/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children become 
warriors for my Son who is truth and mercy. His words are everlasting. My little 
ones become peacemakers, just as my Son was a peacemaker, bringing joy to 
everyone you meet. Children become learned in scripture so that you may not fall 
into the devil's snares. Children live the Gospels so that everyone you meet will 
know that you belong to The Lord. My little ones. Mostly sow seeds of faith by 
your witnessing of God's abiding love. How you treat others shows the true 
nature of your heart. Give graciously. Then your gifts will have true balance 
between being a gift of love and an opportunity to do good works for The Lord. I 
love you my little ones. Know this. 
 

6/17/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children let your songs 
of praise be heard with glad tambourines. Fill the air with the sweet sound of 
adoration for my Son who is truth. Little ones, be mindful of what you are allowing 
to enter into your hearts. Remember that you too are a vessel for The Lord. Only 
when you place God first in your hearts will you begin to realize how often you 
forget him and allow your hearts to become weakened with the near occasion of 
sin. I love you my little ones. I am praying for your continued conversions.  Keep 
my Son close to your hearts. Then everything you do will become a joy. I love 
you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 
6/18/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
Do not fear coming to me. Though your sins are many, my mercy is even greater 
than your many sins. I came into the world to free men from their sins. Not to 
place condemnation upon them. Now is the hour that you must look within your 
own heart. What do you see when you peer inside. A selfless lover of mankind? A 
giver of charity? A peacemaker? Or do you see someone who has caused 
division? Do you harbor grievances against your brother? Are you unwilling to 
forgive them? Have you remained indifferent to the poor by your silence? When 



you walk among my sheep do you listen to their needs or are you thinking only 
about yourself? Repent if you are the latter. I will forgive you. Ask for my mercy 
and it shall be granted unto you. Those who ask shall receive. Those who seek 
shall find. And those who knock, the door will be opened and I shall invite you in 
to dine with me. Remember those who eat of my flesh and drink my blood have 
life within me and I shall raise them up on the last day. My mercy is with you a 
little longer. Come to me and take shelter in my Heart. Night is coming when no 
one will take rest. Those who have remained in me will have nothing to fear. But 
woe to those who have remained indifferent to my mercy. They will seek shelter 
and none will be found. They will look for rest and none will be granted. I love you 
and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
6/19/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children be eager to 
learn your faith. Be ready to give witness to those who have yet to encounter my 
Son. How many of my children never bring my Son to their brothers and sisters? 
How can one hide their talents under a bushel? Learn from scripture. Do not hide 
your light. Instead nourish your flame by reading Sacred scripture. The more you 
learn about what my Son has given to you the more you will realize the 
importance of giving testimony. One can only give testimony when their hearts 
are ready, or your words will be just that. Words. Empty of conviction. I love you 
my little ones. Go and learn. Then give everything to my Son for his blessings. I 
love you and I give you my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

 
6/20/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children take each 
moment and offer it to my Son. Every moment is a gift which should not be 
wasted. Take care to realize that it is only by God's great mercy that you are 
here. He is love. My little ones accept this with your whole hearts. Never take for 
granted what my Son has done for you. He gave up his own life so that you could 
live. Children this gift came at a price. One that he freely gave out of love for you. 
My little ones tonight take a moment and reflect on how much God loves you. 
When difficulties and turmoil arise know that you can trust that God will always be 
with you. Loving you and sheltering you in his Heart. I love you and I give you my 
motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/21/2014 



Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Go out among my sheep and give to them as I have given to you. 
Bring to them hearts that are open and compassionate. Those who care for each 
other with a lasting kindness will receive much. I will shelter them in the abodes 
of my Heart. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
6/22/2014 
Children. It is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children become 
faithful to the teachings of my Son. His words are truth. I love you and I give you 
my motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and eat. For my body is true food. My blood is true drink. 
Whenever you eat of my flesh and drink my blood you reside in me and I in you. 
Do so with your heart open and ready to receive me. Do not come if your heart 
has been closed towards your brothers and sisters. First go and open your hearts 
towards them. Then come and I shall reward you. When you open your hearts 
towards others you are following my commandment to love. Those who keep my 
words with them are my friends and I shall call your name. You will be written in 
the book of life because you loved me and obeyed my teachings. Now come and 
enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart is a 
dwelling place for those who have come to me. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

 
 
6/23/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
My Heart is a vessel of mercy for those who seek shelter in my Heart. Do not be 
afraid to enter into my Heart. Do not be afraid to seek shelter within me. I tell you 
the truth those who seek my Heart will never be turned away. My Heart is a place 
of refuge for sinners. If I have said this, then why do you still remain far from me. 
You still fear coming to me. Where are you tonight? What have you given your 
heart to? I love you. Do not forgo what I am offering to you. Do not forget that I 
have not come to condemn you. No. I have come to bring you into my Heart. I 
have heard your pleas. I have come to bring you comfort. To console your 
woundedness. You do not belong to this world. You belong to me because I have 



offered my life for you. I shed my blood so that you would have life everlasting. 
My blood is my covenant, that I will be with you always. I have not abandoned 
you during this time of trials. I have kept watch with you. I have remained with 
you. Do not distance yourself from me. My love for you is everlasting. My mercy 
is unending for those who trust in me. I love you. Tonight I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

6/24/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children remain faithful 
to my Son's teachings. His words are truth. I love you and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Go out and spread my mercy to 
everyone you meet. Be charitable. Be compassionate. Forgive. These are the 
ways to bring your brothers and sisters to me. Come and follow me. Enter into 
the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
6/25/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. I have prepared a place for you tonight. Come and enter my Heart through 
your yes. Remove the doubts that plague your thoughts. Do not let your fears 
come between us. I love you. That is why I have opened my Heart for you 
tonight. My Heart is mercy because I have been pierced open for the souls of 
men. My blood and water poured forth so that your sins would be cleansed. No 
longer would you be left outside. No, you are welcome in my Heart because I 
have paid your way. Freely. I bore everything without regard to my own 
sufferings. Instead, I focused on you. My love for you. That is why I allowed 
myself to be led away to my execution. That is why I consented to be scourged. 
Beaten and crowned with thorns. Mocked, spit at. Cruelly tortured. Then 
crucified.  I held nothing back. Everything was given for you. Do you still think 
that I cannot love you because you are weak. Yes, you are weak. You fall. I knew 
each and every offense that you would make. When I fell under the weight of 
your sins I did not stay on the ground. I loved you. I rose up and kept going. I 
knew your salvation was just a short distance. Soon everything would be 
justified. Do not fear coming to me because you have sinned. Come to me 



because you have sinned. I alone can forgive you because you belong to me. Do 
not fear. Just come and I will heal you. I will cleanse you with my blood. I will 
comfort you with my Heart and I will nourish you with my body. This is love. You 
have nothing to fear. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
6/26/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Do not fear coming to me tonight. My Heart is a vessel of mercy 
ready to be poured out upon mankind. You only need to ask, to receive what I am 
offering. I have come tonight to once again ask each of you to return your hearts 
to me. Do not be swayed by the things of today. I promise you they will soon be 
gone tomorrow. Come to me. Bring your worries and cares to my Heart. I will 
listen. I am patient. Do not fear retribution for your offenses. Though they are 
many, my mercy is greater. My love for you is infinite. Come to me and bring me 
your sorrows and pains. I will take away your pains and sorrows and replace 
them with joy and comfort. You see how much I love you. No heart can withstand 
my presence without my mercy. That is why I am mercy. So do not fear giving me 
your heart tonight. I love you. Tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
  
6/27/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children as you pray 
tonight try to offer your hearts to my Son. He is mercy. My little ones he came into 
this world so that you may be redeemed by his blood. Blood that poured forth 
from his most Sacred and merciful Heart. The very Heart that he has asked you 
to dwell in. His Heart that he wishes to offer to you at every mass. Children 
tonight go and seek shelter in him. Place yourself at the foot of his cross and join 
me in making an act of reparation to his most Sacred and Merciful Heart. The 
more you embrace your own crosses the more you will resemble him. My little 
ones the cross while difficult and often painful can bring about much joy when 
offered in union with my Son. I love you my little ones. Know this. 
 

Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom you unto my 
Heart. My Heart is a refuge for sinners. Come and enter into the chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. Believe me when I tell you that my Heart is a 
source of strength for sinners. It is where the lost find shelter and the 
downtrodden find hope. Mercy and strength pours out upon all. So tonight, I 
invite you once again to give me your yes. Place your trust in me. I love you. 



Tonight I shelter each of you in the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. Know this. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
 
6/28/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children live your faith 
with steadfast conviction. Prepare your hearts for my Son by living his messages. 
Bring about hope to those who are hopeless. Bring joy to those in despair. Bring 
faith to those who are struggling to find God. Be an example to everyone you 
meet. Share what you have received. My little ones do not be afraid to live out 
your vocations to the fullest. I love you my little ones. Tonight I shelter you in my 
immaculate heart. Come to me when you are frightened. I will place my mantle of 
motherly love around you. I love you my little ones and I give you my motherly 
blessings. Know this. 
  
6/29/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children do not fear 
going to my Son. He is mercy. His love for each of you is eternal. Know this my 
little ones. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. 
  
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Return your hearts to me, for I am meek and gentle of heart. My love for 
you is eternal. Just as my mercy is unending. Especially for those who trust in 
me. Do not be afraid of coming to me. Do not allow your fears to cause you to 
grow further from my love. My love for you is not based on your behavior. My 
love is just that. Love. I died so that you may live. I suffered so that you may be 
free from sin. Everything I bore for you was out of my love for you. Do not fear 
me. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

6/30/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Begin anew. Open your hearts tonight and begin anew. Do not hold 
onto past mistakes. Do not dwell on past failures. Remain in the present moment. 
Here you can change. This is where you can choose. I love you and tonight I give 
you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/1/2014 



Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
Tonight, I bring to each of you my merciful Heart. My Heart is a source of comfort 
and rest for those who have become weary. Come and rest in me. Tonight, I will 
place, in any child who asks of me, graces to accomplish my will. My will is not 
burdensome. You only need to trust in me. I love you. Tonight I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/2/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming by trusting in my mercy. I am 
mercy. It is my desire that you return your hearts to me. Renew yourself by 
coming to me with a trusting heart. Do not be afraid. The longer you remain 
distant from me the further you become lost in your sins. When you enter into my 
Heart I place you in my chambers. Each chamber brings you in closer union to 
me. Tonight, I desire that you enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and 
Merciful Heart. I will place my mercy in you and cleanse your sins. You will no 
longer be far from me. You will remain united to me. Remain in me as I remain in 
you by entering into my Heart. My Heart that has been pierced open for your 
salvation. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/3/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Prepare your hearts for my coming. Go out and bring my lost 
something good to eat. Go out and search for my sheep and give them 
something to drink. What you do for the least of these you do for me. Do not fear 
bringing my words of hope to your brothers and sisters. Teach them about my 
mercy. This is why I have come tonight. To encourage each of you to bring about 
change. First with your own hearts. Then those I have sent you. This will only 
happen when you love. Trust in what I am telling you. I am love.  I love you and I 
give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/4/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My 
Heart is a vessel of love and mercy for those who give me their yes. I love you. 
Tonight, I have come to once again offer my Heart. Again, I ask you to not fear 
coming to me. Do not think that I am waiting to condemn your transgressions. I 



have not come to condemn you. I have come to raise you up. To cleanse your 
sins. To bring you home. You belong to my Heart. I love you. Take what I am 
telling you and ponder my words. Do not fear coming to me. My Heart is not 
hardened towards you. It is your hearts that have become hardened. Do not 
worry, I will melt your hearts. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
  
7/5/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart 
is a vessel of mercy for any child who trusts in me. I love you. Tonight, I have 
come to set a fire within you. A fire of love for truth. Look into your hearts and 
see. Not with deception. With truth. Ask for the grace to see. I will cast a light on 
the areas that you have allowed to remain in the dark. I will do this so that you 
may see. Not to cause you distress, but so that you may repent while there is 
time. Soon I will come to judge mankind. Then all will be brought to light. I am 
truth. There can be no deception before me. I will cast a light so that darkness 
will not prevail. Come to me and trust in me. I am mercy. This is a time of mercy 
so that each of you can change. You only need to come to me with true 
repentance and I will forgive you. A contrite heart, I will never turn away. My gaze 
is always on those who are trying to please me. How many souls comfort me with 
their ardent acts of faith? They trust because they have believed me. Judgement 
will not come upon them. They are already sheltered in my Heart. Give me your 
yes tonight, so that I may place you in my first chamber. Ask and you shall 
receive. I love you and tonight I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/6/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Children I call you this because you are children. You belong to my Heart 
because I have offered my life for you. I have paid your debts. No longer are you 
slaves to sin. You are children of the Father. You only need to trust in me and I 
shall give you eternal life. How do you trust in me? By accepting my will. By 
freely giving me your yes, thereby giving me your own heart. I shall come and 
make my dwelling with you. That is why I tell you that I shall give you eternal life. 
Because you are already living in me. Come and enter into the chambers of my 
most Sacred and Merciful Heart. My Heart which has been pierced open for the 
salvation of men. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/7/2014 



Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Persevere my little 
ones. Especially in your prayers. Do not let your distractions cause you to stop 
praying. When you become distracted simply close your eyes and remember 
how much my Son loves you. Thank him for his sacrifice. Tell him you are sorry 
for offending him and promise to try harder to obey God's laws. I love you my 
little ones. Prayer is important as you grow in faith. Just as acts of charity are 
also important. My little ones strive to have both strong prayer lives and acts of 
charity. Always remembering to offer everything to my Son. Then he will bless 
your efforts. I love you my little ones and I pray for your continued conversions. 
Know this. 
 

7/8/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming by removing those things that you have allowed to 
take root in your hearts. Malice, greed, division, corruption, immorality, bitterness 
towards your brothers and sisters. Your hearts should always be ready to forgive. 
Your hearts should be full of compassion, integrity, kindness, patience, courage 
and steadfast devotion. (to God) Do not be troubled by the condition of your own 
heart. Give to me all of your iniquities and I will cleanse them. Show me your 
weakness and I shall give you strength. Place your sorrows at my feet and I will 
turn them into joys. Trust in my mercy. A repentant heart causes me to receive it 
tenderly and with much compassion. How I desire that every soul comes to me 
with trust and true repentance. I love you. Tonight, again I ask you to look within. 
Change. Then come to me and I will place you in the chambers of my most 
Sacred and Merciful Heart. You belong to me because I have loved you from the 
beginning. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/9/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children to bring others 
closer to my Son you must first entrust your own heart to him. Then work hard to 
live out your vocation. Others will see the happiness and joy that you have and 
wish for that in their own lives. Freely give to others so that you may realize the 
fruits of charity. My little ones, no one can bring another to the heart of my Son 
without first loving that person. Then you must live by your testimony. I love you 
my little ones. Go and bear fruit for the kingdom. I love you and I give you my 
motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

 



7/10/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Take heart my little 
ones. You are not alone. My Son is with you. He has come to bring men's hearts 
back to the Father. You must listen to him. Turn your hearts away from the things 
of this world. They only bring you a temporary joy. My Son will bring you eternal 
happiness. Trust in him my little ones. Know that I am praying before the throne 
of God on your behalf. I am your Mother. My immaculate heart is always open to 
comfort my children. Take what I have told you and place all of this in your 
hearts. You must decide for my Son. Give him your yes. My children I love you 
and I place each of you under my mantle of motherly love. Know this. 
 

7/11/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts 
unto myself. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. I love you. When you come to me do not be afraid. My Heart is one of 
mercy. Not condemnation. That is why I tell you do not be afraid. Whenever you 
come to me do so with trust. Knowing that you belong to me because I have paid 
your debt with my blood. Here within my chambers you will find salvation. Come 
to me and give me your yes. I will place you in my first chamber. Anyone who 
enters my Heart will never feel afraid. My love will envelope them. My mercy will 
infiltrate their souls. You will be united to my Holy and Divine will. I love you. 
Remember that you are more than flesh and bones. It is this reason that I have 
told you all of this. So that you might not be afraid. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/12/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Prepare for my coming. Prepare your hearts by removing those obstacles 
that have caused you to distance yourself from me. Remove your doubts. 
Remove your fears. Remove your lack of faith. Remove your distrusts. All of 
these are your walls that you have surrounded yourself with. Layers of deceit that 
have permeated your sense of self. You have forgotten how much I love you. You 
have forgotten that you belong to my Heart because I have prepared a place for 
you. You have forgotten that I have opened my Heart for you. Do not allow these 
barriers to separate us. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred 
and Merciful Heart. Bathe yourself in the blood of redemption that my Heart has 
poured out for you. Shelter yourself in my graces. Everything I have I offer freely 
to you. This is how much I love you. You are not lost to me. Just open your heart 
and I will remove the stains of your sins. I shall wash away your iniquities and 



defend you as my own. Trust in me for I am truth. Those who have trusted in me 
and remain in my Heart have nothing to fear. I love you. Come to me and do not 
be afraid because I have loved you from the beginning. I love you and I give you 
my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
7/13/2014  
Brothers and sisters, it is our Heavenly King, coming to ransom your hearts unto 
myself. Greed, impropriety, carelessness, lack of faith. These are the traits that I 
am asking each of you to rid yourselves of through my grace. Do not allow any of 
these to interfere with your acts of charity. I love you. Place your sins at my feet 
and I will forgive you. Tonight I ask each of you to enter into my second chamber. 
(Jesus most Sacred and Merciful Heart.) Here you will receive mercy. Mercy that 
I wish for you to give to those who are in need. I love you and I give you my 
priestly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/14/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. Children listen to my 
Son. His words are truth. You must become vigilant safeguarding your souls. 
Many of you are falling easily into temptations. Do not blaspheme. Do not bear 
false witness. Do not steal. Do not commit adultery. Children if you do not 
safeguard your souls, you will fall into sin. My little ones the devil wishes for you 
to fall. Do not allow him to distract you. Remain focused on my Son. My little 
ones you are precious to your Heavenly Father. That is why he gave you his only 
Son. To deliver his children from their sins. You must repent and return your 
hearts to God. He alone is Lord. There is no one else my little ones that loves 
you more. Know this. I love you and I give you my motherly blessings. 
 

7/15/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
My Heart is a dwelling place for those who trust in my mercy. I love you. This is 
my message for tonight. I love you. To trust in my teachings, you must trust in 
me. I desire that you abide in me as I abide in you. I desire for you to keep the 
commandments. I desire for you to live according to my teachings. But, before 
you can do this, you must first believe that I love you. When you believe in me 
you will follow what I am telling you. You will trust me and my will because you 
will know that I have loved you from the beginning. Look to my Heart. See how 



my Heart has been pierced open for you. I love you and I give you my priestly 
blessings. Know this. 
 
 
7/16/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Come and enter into the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful Heart. 
What I offer to you, I offer freely. Give then to each other what I have given to 
you. Forgiveness and mercy. Within these two words love flourishes. To forgive 
someone their debts is to love them. To show mercy is to bestow a gift of charity. 
How quickly a person's heart will change when love is given rather than 
condemnation. Love as I have loved you. Forgive freely just as I freely forgive 
you. Be merciful just as you receive my mercy.  What you sow today you will yield 
tomorrow. Sow seeds of charity and you will yield an abundant harvest. I love you 
and I give you my priestly blessings. Know this. 
 
7/17/2014 
Brothers and sisters, it is I your Heavenly King, calling each of you unto my 
Heart. Bring about conversions by living these messages. My words are truth. Go 
out among my lost sheep and teach them about my mercy. Live what you teach 
by offering mercy to everyone. Especially those who are difficult. They are the 
ones who most need it. They are lost but can easily return to my Heart. By loving 
those who are easy to love how difficult is that. To love those who are angry and 
persecute you. This will yield you many graces. Every child is valuable to my 
Father in Heaven. Every child is deserving of love and mercy. Forgiveness and 
charity. You must look past their hardened hearts and see the true beauty that 
lies within. They are beautiful because they are loved. It was for all that I offered 
my life as a ransom. Bring souls to the chambers of my most Sacred and Merciful 
Heart. My Heart is a vessel of graces ready to be poured out upon mankind. 
Blessed are those who hear these words and sow them. They will yield many 
fruits and I will bless their efforts. I love you and I give you my priestly blessings. 
Know this. 
 

7/18/2014 
Children, it is I your Heavenly Mother, my dear little ones. My children, take each 
moment and learn. This is a time of many graces. Each day you are given many 
opportunities to learn about God's mercy. You have many chances to show 
others mercy. Love is not only about receiving. It is about giving. Sharing with 



each other. My children you are given so many opportunities to share and give 
witness to God's love. Take this time and bring about conversions. First within 
yourselves and then within your families. Finally, with everyone around you. Pray 
my little ones. Pray for each other. Ask God to bless your days and give you the 
graces necessary to grow. I love you my little ones and I pray for you to grow in 
holiness. Especially during this time of grace. I love you and I give you my 
motherly blessings. Know this. 
 

7/19/2014 
3 1/2 year - Anniversary 
  
Children, it is I your Heavenly Father. Tonight I give you my blessings of peace. 
Return your hearts to me. Remember that you belong to my Heart. Out of earth I 
created you. My breath gave you life. I love you. You have many adversities 
today. Temptations and obstacles. You have removed yourself by your actions. 
Return to my Heart. Do not allow your choices to become barriers. Do not place 
things between us. I love you. Out of the depths I have called each of you. Out of 
darkness I have delivered you. Do you not see that you belong to me? I have not 
abandoned you. I have not left you orphaned. Each moment I am here ready to 
receive you. Each moment I have given you the gift of free will to decide to 
remain in my Heart or to leave me. Choose wisely. I have given you the task to 
change from within. Have you taken this task to heart? Have you tried, or are you 
allowing your trials to cause you to remain the same? My children to change 
takes great effort and desire. Your sorrows come from your lack of love. When 
you choose against my will then you endure much sufferings. As soon as you 
again choose to return to my Heart, peace returns. Choose wisely. This is my 
task for you going forward. Choose wisely. Do not seek opportunities only to later 
find out that you did not seek my will. Be patient. Trust me. Know that I am with 
you always. You are a treasure to my Heart. I love you. This is what I will for you. 
To choose my Heart. I love you and I give you my blessings as you go forward. 
Know this. 
  

 


